
CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: Lab Water Testing

Dept./Div.: Various

Requisition No.:  Various IFB 20004S   11/21/2019 at 11:00 AM

No.:

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE & ZIP:

Recommended for Award

QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?

QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?

LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?

Item #   ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY U/M UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

PLEASE READ ALL BID/PROPOSAL RESPONSES TO ENSURE THAT ALL INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM VENDOR IS REVIEWED AND USED IN EVALUATION PROCESS

Trophies and Awards

9 Drinking Water and Well Water Samples

a. Inorganics:

Aluminum $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Antimony $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Arsenic $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Asbestos $250.00 . $200.00 $250.00
.

$200.00

Beryllium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Barium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Cadmium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Chloride $20.00 $20.00 . $10.00 . $10.00

Chromium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Copper $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Cyanide $15.00 $25.00 $20.00 . $12.00

Fluoride $15.00 $25.00 $20.00 . $10.00

Iron $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Lead $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Manganese $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Mercury $18.00 $25.00 $14.00
.

$12.00

Nitrate $15.00 $25.00 . $7.00 $9.00

Nitrite $15.00 $25.00 . $7.00 $9.00

Nickel $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Selenium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silver $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Sulfates $20.00 $20.00 $17.00 . $15.00

Thallium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Zinc $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

b.  Pesticides: $100.00 $110.00 $85.00 . $80.00

Alachlor included in above price $110.00 $0.00 . Included under b. Pesticides

Atrazine included in above price $110.00 $0.00 . Included under b. Pesticides

Simazine included in above price $110.00 $0.00 . Included under b. Pesticides

c.  Volatile Organic Compounds, Method 524.2 $90.00 $75.00 $65.00 . $50.00

d.  Total Organic Carbon $20.00 $28.00 . $14.00 $18.00

e.  Disinfectant Byproducts:  . $75.00 $ $

 Haloacetic Acids ("HAA5") $65.00 $75.00 $60.00 . $50.00

 Trihalomethanes $35.00 $55.00 $35.00 . $30.00

f.  Total Dissolved Solids . $9.00 $20.00 $10.00 . $9.00

g.  Gross Alpha/Beta $100.00 $80.00 $110.00 . $50.00

  Radon $150.00 $125.00 $90.00 . $60.00

h.  Rush Analysis Surcharge: $ $

     24 hour rush 200 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements100% 200% 100%

     48 hour rush 100 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements75% 100% 75%

     72 hour rush 75 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements50% 50% 50%

No

No

2
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No

X

1
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Lima, OH 45805

dba Alloway

3
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Dublin, OH 43017
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X

No No
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No
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No

4

Pace Analytical

Englewood, OH 45322

X



$ $ $

10 Calcium oxide (quick lime) and aqueous solutino samples of calcium carbonate . $7.00 $50.00 $ $

Aluminum $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $5.00

Barium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $5.00

Calcium  $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $5.00

Iron $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $5.00

Lead $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $5.00

Magnesium $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $5.00

Magnanese $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $5.00

Silicon $20.00 . $15.00 $35.00 NB

Sulfur $80.00 $45.00 . $35.00 . $35.00

Rush Analysis Surcharge: $ $ $

24 hour rush 200 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements100% 200% 100%

48 hour rush 100 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements75% 100% 75%

72 hour rush 75 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements50% 50% 50%

11 Environmental compliance $ $ $ $

a.  Metals: $ $ $ $

Aluminum . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Antimony . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Arsenic . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Beryllium . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Barium . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Cadmium . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Chromium . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Copper . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Iron . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Lead . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Manganese . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Mercury $15.00 $25.00 $14.00 . $12.00

Nickel . $4.00 $12.00
$6.00 . $4.00

Selenium . $4.00 $12.00
$6.00 . $4.00

Silver . $4.00 $12.00
$6.00 . $4.00

Sodium . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Thallium . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Zinc . $4.00
$12.00

$6.00 . $4.00

Molybdenum . $4.00 $12.00 $6.00 . $4.00

b.  Inorganics:

Ammonia Free $15.00 $15.00 . $14.00 NB

Ammonia Total . $9.00 $15.00 $14.00 $12.00

Chloride $20.00 $20.00 . $10.00 . $10.00

Total Cyanide $15.00 $25.00 $20.00 . $12.00

Free Cyanide(Low Level) . $15.00 $45.00 $30.00 . $15.00

Amenable Cyanide . $15.00 $30.00 $20.00 . $15.00

Dissolved Oxygen . $5.00 $8.00 $7.00 $8.00

Fluoride
$20.00 $25.00 . $20.00 . $10.00

Nitrate
$15.00 $25.00 . $7.00 $9.00

Nitrite
$10.00 $25.00 . $7.00 $9.00

Oil and Grease . $18.00 $45.00 $27.00 . $18.00

pH . $5.00 $10.00 . $5.00 . $5.00

Phosphorus
$9.00 $18.00 $10.00 . $4.00

Orthophosphate (as P) . $9.00 $20.00 $10.00 $12.00

Sulfate
$20.00 $20.00 $17.00 . $15.00

Sulifide . $20.00 $30.00 $35.00 . $15.00

Suspended Solids . $8.00 $15.00 . $8.00 . $8.00

Total Solids
$8.00 $15.00 $8.00 . $7.00



Total Dissolved Solids . $9.00 $15.00 $10.00 . $9.00

Volatile Solids . $8.00 $15.00 . $8.00 . $8.00

Total Kjeldahi Nitrogen(TKN) . $12.00 $25.00 $14.00 . $12.00

Total chlorine . $5.00 $15.00 $12.00 $10.00

Chemical Oxygen Demand(COD)
$18.00 $25.00 . $15.00 . $15.00

Biochemical Oxygen Demand (BOD)/Carbonaceous BOD (cBOD)
$18.00 $25.00 . $15.00 . $15.00

Hexavalent Chromium . $12.00 $60.00 . $12.00 . $12.00

c.  Bacteria: .

Fecal coliform
$20.00 $30.00 . $17.95 . $15.00

E.coli
$20.00 $30.00 $17.95 . $15.00

d.  Organics:PCB's

PCB's

    Aqueous

              8082 $90.00 $50.00 $90.00 . $45.00

              608 $90.00 $50.00 $90.00 . $45.00

              600/4-81-045 no bid . $50.00 $90.00 NB

              8260 no bid $70.00 $90.00 . $50.00

              8270 no bid $135.00 . $90.00 $100.00

Non-Aqueous .

              8082
$90.00 $50.00 $125.00 . $45.00

              608 no bid
$50.00 $125.00 . $45.00

              600/4-81-045 no bid . $50.00 $125.00 NB

              8260 no bid
$70.00 $125.00 . $50.00

              8270 no bid
$135.00 $165.00 . $100.00

e.  Rush Analysis Surcharge

    24 hour rush 200 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements

100% 200%

100%

    48 hour rush 100 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements

75% 100%

75%

    72 hour rush 75 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements
50% 50%

50%

f. Perflourocarbons Full List
UCMR3 List Method 537.1    [X]Yes or []NoMethod 537    [x]Yes or []NoMethod    []Yes or []No Method    [x]Yes or []No

$350.00 $350.00 $650.00 . $250.00

g. PFOA/PFOS Only Option 
Method 537.1   [X]Yes or []No . Method 537   [x]Yes or []No Method    []Yes or []No . Method    [x]Yes or []No

$325.00 . $295.00 $405.00 . $250.00

. .

m. Cost for transporting samples . No Charge for Weekly Pick-ups on Wednesdays and Thursdays . $0.00 $10.00 . $0.00

Environmental compliance

12 a. Metals:

Aluminum . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Antimony . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Arsenic . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Beryllium . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Barium . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Cadmium . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Chromium . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Copper . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Iron . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Lead . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Manganese . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Mercury
$15.00 $25.00 $14.00 . $12.00

Nickel . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Selenium . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silver . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00



Sodium . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Thallium . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Zinc . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

b. Inorganics:  

Amonia Free $15.00 $15.00 . $14.00 NB

Amonia Total . $9.00 $15.00 $14.00 $12.00

Chloride $20.00 $20.00 . $10.00 . $10.00

Cyainde $15.00 $25.00 . $20.00 . $12.00

Dissolved Oxygen . $5.00 $8.00 $7.00 $8.00

Fluoride $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 . $10.00

Nitrate $15.00 $25.00 . $7.00 $9.00

Nitrite $10.00 $25.00 . $7.00 $9.00

Oil and Grease . $18.00 $45.00 $27.00 . $18.00

pH . $5.00 $10.00 . $5.00 . $5.00

Phosphate $10.00 $20.00 . $10.00 . $4.00

Sulfates $20.00 $20.00 $17.00 . $15.00

Suspended Solids . $8.00 $15.00 . $8.00 . $8.00

Total chlorine . $5.00 $15.00 $12.00 $10.00

MBAS $50.00 $55.00 . $20.00 $25.00

c. Bacteria:

Fecal Coliform $20.00 . $30.00 $17.95 . $15.00

Microcystins $80.00 . $30.00 $150.00 NB

d. PCB's: .

Aqueous .

8082 $90.00 $50.00 $90.00 . $45.00

608 $90.00 $50.00 $90.00 . $45.00

600/4-81-045 no bid . $50.00 $90.00 NB

Non-Aqueous

8082 $90.00 $50.00 $125.00 . $45.00

608 no bid . $50.00 $125.00 . $45.00

600/4-81-045 no bid . $50.00 $125.00 NB

e. Perflourocarbons Full List UCMR3 List Method 537.1 [X]Yes or []NoMethod    []Yes or []No Method    []Yes or []No Method    [x]Yes or []No

$350.00 $350.00 $650.00 . $250.00

.
f. PFOA/PFOS Only Option Method 537.1   [x]Yes or []No Method    []Yes or []No Method    []Yes or []No Method    [x]Yes or []No

$325.00 $295.00 $405.00 . $250.00

 

h. 1,4 Dioxane Method  8260  [x]Yes or []No Method    []Yes or []No Method    []Yes or []No Method    [x]Yes or []No

$90.00 $90.00 $110.00 . $75.00

j. Asbestos(Bulk samples - PLM) $250.00 . $20.00 $100.00 . NB

k. Tritium Method 906 [x]Yes or []No Method    []Yes or [x]No Method    []Yes or []No Method    [x]Yes or []No

$125.00 $ N/A . $80.00

l. Sample Preparation Charges (e.g. digestion non-potable, GFAA, ICP, ICPMS

Included in cost of analysis $0.00 NO CHARGE $0.00

m. Sample Collection Charge

$70 per hour portal to portal $75/hr Per Project / Tech $105/HR . $45/hr

n.  Rush Analysis Surcharge

    24 hour rush 200 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements. 100% 200% 100%

    48 hour rush 100 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements. 75% 100% 75%

    72 hour rush 75 % Surcharge *Dependent on prior approval from lab and method requirements. 50% 50% . 50%

.

Cost for transporting samples No Charge for Weekly pick-ups on Wednesdays and Thursdays$0.00 $10.00 . $0.00

.

Testing Services .

13 Aluminum, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Aluminum, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Aluminum, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Aluminium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Aluminum, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Aluminum, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Aluminum, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00



Antimony, Dissolved, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Antimony, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Antimony, Dissolved, ICPSM . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Antimony, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Antimony, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Antimony, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Anitomy, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Antimony, Potable, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Antimony, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Arsenic, Dissolved, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Arsenic, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00
Arsenic, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00
Arsenic, GFAA

no bid $ $8.00 . $4.00
Arsenic, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00
Arsenic, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00
Arsenic, Potable

$7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00
Arsenic, Potable, GFAA

no bid $ $8.00 NB
Arsenic, Potable, ICPMS

$7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00
Asbestos, Water (Subcontract)

$250.00 . $200.00 $250.00 . $200.00
Barium, Dissolved, GFAA

no bid $ . $8.00 NB
Barium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00
Barium, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00
Barium, GFAA

no bid $ . $8.00 NB
Barium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00
Barium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00
Barium, Potable

$7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00
Barium, Potable, ICP

$7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00
Barium, Potable, ICPMS

$7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00
BASE NEUT. And/Or ACID COMPS. - TCLP

$110.00 $160.00 $125.00 . $100.00
BASE NEUT. And/Or ACID COMPS.-625 Aq

$200.00 $135.00 $90.00 . $100.00
BASE NEUT. And/Or ACID COMPS.-625 Non-aq

$200.00 $135.00 $125.00 . $100.00
BASE NEUTRAL COMPS. - Napthalene Only

$85.00 $90.00 $90.00 . $65.00
Beryllium, Dissolved, GFAA

no bid $ . $8.00 NB
Beryllium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00
Beryllium, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00
Beryllium, GFAA

no bid $ . $8.00 NB
Beryllium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00
Beryllium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00
Beryllium, Potable

$7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00
Beryllium, Potable, GFAA

no bid $ . $8.00 NB
Beryllium, Potable, ICPMS

$7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00
Bismuth, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $25.00 . $4.00
Bismuth, ICP WW . $4.00 $15.00 $25.00 . $4.00
BOD

$18.00 $25.00 . $15.00 . $15.00
Boron, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00
Boron, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

BTEX 8260 $50.00 $45.00 $55.00 . $40.00

BTEX/MTBE/TBA 8020 AQUEOUS no bid . $30.00 $150.00 $40.00

Cadmium, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 . NB

Cadmium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 . $4.00

Cadmium, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Cadmium, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB

Cadmium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Cadmium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Cadmium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 . $6.00 . $4.00

Cadmium, Potable, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB

Cadmium, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Calcium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Calcium, ICP $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Calcium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Calcium, Potable,ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

CBOD $18.00 $28.00 . $15.00 . $15.00

Chromium, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 . NB

Chromium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00
Chromium, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Chromium, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB

Chromium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Chromium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Chromium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Chromium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00



Chromium, Potable, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB

Chromium, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Chromium, Total  GFAA
no bid $ . $8.00 NB

Chromium, Trivalent $22 *Calculation (Total Cr - Hex 

Cr) $15.00
. $12.00

NB
Chromium, Hexavalent $15.00 $50.00 . $12.00 $18.00

Cobalt  GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB
Cobalt, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB
Cobalt, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Cobalt, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Cobalt, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Cobalt, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Cobalt, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

COD $18.00 $25.00 . $15.00 . $15.00

Copper, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $ $8.00 NB

Copper, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Copper, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Copper, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Copper, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Copper, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Copper, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Copper, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Copper, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Cyanide, Total $15.00 $25.00 $20.00 . $12.00

Digestion, Potable, GFAA no bid $ No Charge NB

Dissolved Oxygen . $5.00 $8.00 $7.00 $8.00

Dry Weight $8.00 $8.00 . $3.00

EP - Aluminum, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Arsenic, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Arsenic, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

EP - Barium, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Cadmium, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Cadmium, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

EP - Chromium, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Chromium, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

EP - Copper, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Copper, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

EP - Lead, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Lead, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

EP - Nickel, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Nickel, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

EP - Selenium, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Silver, ICP . no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Silver, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

EP - Zinc, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

EP - Zinc, ICPMS no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

Glycols 8015 $85 each $75.00 $110.00 . $45.00

Gross Alpha $50.00 . $45.00 $55.00 . $45.00

Gross Beta $50.00 . $45.00 $55.00 . $45.00

HERBICIDES - TCLP $96.00 $160.00 $125.00 . $90.00

Iron, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Iron, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Iron, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Iron, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Iron, Suspended, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $8.00 . $6.00

Lead, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $ $8.00 NB

Lead, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Lead, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 . $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Lead, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Lead, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Lead, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Lead, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Lead, Potable, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Lead, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Lithium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $20.00 $6.00

Lithium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $20.00 . $4.00

Magnesium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Magnesium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Magnesium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Magnesium, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00



Manganese, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 . $8.00 $6.00

Manganese, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 . $15.00 $6.00

Manganese, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Manganese, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Manganese, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Manganese, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Manganese, Suspended, ICP . $7.00 $8.00 $8.00

Mercury $15.00 $25.00 $14.00 . $12.00

Mercury, CVAA $15.00 $25.00 $14.00 . $12.00

Mercury, Dissolved $20.00 $25.00 $16.00 . $14.00

Mercury, Dissolved, CVAA $20.00 $25.00 $16.00 . $14.00

Mercury, Potable $18.00 $25.00 $14.00 . $12.00

Mercury, Potable, CVAA $18.00 $25.00 $14.00 . $12.00

Mercury, Potable, ICPMS no bid $25.00 . $20.00 NB

Metals-RCA 8 $67.00 $74.00 $48.00 . $40.00

Metals—Priority Pollutants $109.00 $85.00 $78.00 . $60.00

Metals—VAP 16 no bid $100.00 N/A . $72.00

Metals-Tal 23 List $172.00 $135.00 $138.00 . $100.00

Molybdenum, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB

Molybdenum, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 . $6.00

Molybdenum, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Molybdenum, GFAA no bid $ . $8.00 NB

Molybdenum, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Molybdenum, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Nickel, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Nickel, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Nickel, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Nickel, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Nickel, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Nickel, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Nickel, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Nitrogen, Ammonia Direct . $9.00 $18.00 $14.00 NB

Nitrogen, Ammonia Direct(0.02) . no bid $18.00 . $14.00 NB

Nitrogen, Ammonia Dist. Non-aq $20.00 $18.00 . $16.00 NB

Nitrogen, Nitrate  Non-aq $15.00 $25.00 . $9.00 . $9.00

Nitrogen, Nitrite (Potable) $15.00 $25.00 . $7.00 $9.00

Nitrogen, Nitrite, Non-aqueous $10.00 $25.00 . $9.00 . $9.00

Oil & Grease (HEM) . $18.00 $45.00 $27.00 . $18.00

PESTICIDES – TCLP $75.00 $105.00 $125.00 . $50.00

Pesticides/PCBs [608] [8082] for Soil, Water, Oil and Wipes . $90.00 $125.00 $125.00 $95.00

pH . $5.00 $10.00 . $5.00 . $5.00

Phosphorus $9.00 $18.00 $10.00 . $4.00

Potash (K20), ICP . $7.00 $40.00 $10.00

Potash (K2O), ICP . $7.00 $40.00 $10.00

Potassium Available no bid . $15.00 . $15.00 NB

Potassium, Available, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

Potassium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Potassium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Potassium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Potassium, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

SDWA PESTICIDES $110.00 $175.00 $90.00 . $85.00

Selenium, Dissolved, GFAA no bid . $8.00 . NB

Selenium, Dissolved, GFAA no bid . $8.00 . NB

Selenium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Selenium, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Selenium, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Selenium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Selenium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Selenium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 $4.00

Selenium, Potable, GFAA no bid $8.00 NB

Selenium, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Silica, Dissolved, ICP $25.00 $50.00 $8.00 . $6.00

Silica, ICP $25.00 $50.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silica, Potable $25.00 $50.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silica, Potable, ICP $25.00 $50.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silicon, Dissolved, ICP no bid $15.00 . $8.00 NB

Silicon, ICP no bid $15.00 . $6.00 NB

Silver, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $0.00 . $8.00 NB

Silver, Dissolved, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Silver, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00



Silver, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 $6.00

Silver, GFAA no bid $8.00 NB

Silver, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silver, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Silver, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silver, Potable, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Silver, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Silver, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Sodium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Sodium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Sodium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Sodium, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Solids, Suspended . $8.00 $15.00 . $8.00 . $8.00

SPLP – Aluminum, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP – Antimony, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP – Antimony, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP – Arsenic, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP – Arsenic, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP – Barium, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP – Barium, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Beryllium, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Beryllium, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Cadmium, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Cadmium, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Chromium, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Chromium, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Cobalt, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Cobalt, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Copper, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Copper, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Iron, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Lead, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Lead, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Manganese, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Manganese, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Nickel, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Nickel, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Selenium, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Silver, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Silver, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Thallium, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Thallium, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

SPLP - Vanadium, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Zinc, ICP 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $6.00 NB

SPLP - Zinc, ICPMS 7 * Plus 1 time extraction fee of $51 $50.00 . $15.00 NB

Strontium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $6.00

Strontium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Sulfur, Total, Non-aqueous $80.00 $45.00 . $35.00 . $35.00

SVOCs [8207-VAP] no bid $135.00 N/A . $100.00

[8270] Soil, 8270 SIM Water PNA/PAH $140.00 . $80.00 $250.00 $85.00

Appendix 1x 8270 Water & Soil $200.00 $135.00 $250.00 . PAH by 8270 $65

Library search- TlCs 8270 Included in SVOC analysis . $25.00 $250.00 $30.00

TCLP - Antimony, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Antimony, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Arsenic . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Arsenic, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Arsenic, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Barium . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Barium, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Barium, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Beryllium, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Cadmium . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Cadmium, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Cadmium, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Chromium . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Chromium, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Chromium, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Chromium, hex $12.00 $75.00 $12.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Cobalt, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Cobalt, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00



TCLP – Copper . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Copper, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Copper, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Iron, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Lead . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Lead, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Lead, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Manganese, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Manganese, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Mercury $15.00 $60.00 $14.00 . $12.00

TCLP – Nickel . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Nickel, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Nickel, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Selenium . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Selenium, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Silver . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Silver, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP – Silver, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Thallium, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Thallium, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Vanadium, ICP . $4.00 $18.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP VOCs, TCLP Metals $113.00 $144.00 $180.00 . $90.00

TCLP VOCs & SVOCs $171.00 $205.00 $250.00 . $150.00

TCLP Metals, VOCs, SVOCs $223.00 $279.00 $300.00 . $190.00

TCLP Full- Metals, VOCs, SVOCs . $223.00 $348.00 $380.00

 Pesticides & Herbicides $157.00 $494.00 $250.00 . $140.00

TCLP - ZHE VOLATILE EXTRACTION . $41.00 $25.00 $78.75 $50.00

TCLP – Zinc . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Zinc, ICP . $4.00 $40.00 $6.00 . $4.00

TCLP - Zinc, ICPMS . $4.00 $40.00 $15.00 . $4.00

TCLP Extraction Inorganic $41.00 . $25.00 $78.75 $50.00

TCLP Extraction Organic $41.00 . $25.00 $78.75 $50.00

Temperature $5.00 $5.00 . $4.00

Thallium, Dissolved, GFAA no bid $8.00 NB

Thallium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 . $4.00

Thallium, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Thallium, GFAA no bid . $8.00 NB

Thallium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Thallium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Thallium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Thallium, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Thallium, Potable, GFAA no bid $8.00 NB

Thallium, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Tin, Dissolved . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Tin, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Tin, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Tin, Potable no bid $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Tin, Potable, ICP no bid $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Titanium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $25.00 . $4.00

Titanium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $25.00 . $4.00

TPH - 8015 All Ranges or Fingerprint $119.00 $100.00 $230.00 . $90.00

TPH [8015], [GRO], [DRO] soil $119.00 $90.00 $230.00 . $75.00

TPH - DRO AQUEOUS $70.00 $50.00 $100.00 . $40.00

TPH - DRO Non-Aqueous $70.00 $50.00 $100.00 . $40.00

TPH - GRO (Aqueous) $49.00 $40.00 $100.00 . $35.00

TPH - GRO (Non-Aqueous) $49.00 $40.00 $100.00 . $35.00

TRIHALOMETHANES - 524.2 $35.00 $55.00 $35.00 . $30.00

Turbidity, Screen $10.00 $18.00 $25.00 . $8.00

Vanadium, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 . $8.00 . $4.00

Vanadium, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Vanadium, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Vapor Analyses no bid N/A . $4.00

        Method 18-Tedlar bags no bid N/A . $110.00

        Method to 14 summa canisters no bid N/A . $175.00

        Method to 15 Summa canisters no bid N/A . $175.00

VOLATILE COMPOUNDS - 524.2 $90.00 $75.00 $65.00 . $50.00

VOLATILE COMPOUNDS – 624 $90.00 $70.00 $90.00 . $50.00

VOLATILE COMPOUNDS - 624 BTEX Only $50.00 $45.00 $55.00 . $35.00

VOLATILE COMPOUNDS - 624 Nonaq $90.00 $70.00 $125.00 . $50.00

VOLATILE COMPOUNDS – 8260 $90.00 $70.00 $90.00 . $50.00



VOLATILE COMPOUNDS - 8260 (AQ) $90.00 . $70.00 $90.00 . $50.00

VOLATILE COMPOUNDS 8260 (<5) $90.00 . $45.00 $90.00 $50.00

VOLATILE COMPOUNDS 8260 (<1) $90.00 . $45.00 $90.00 $50.00

1,4 Dioxane $90.00 . $75.00 $110.00 . $75.00

SEMI-VOLATILE COMPOUNDS (8270) $200.00 $135.00 . $90.00 $100.00

VOLATILES - M 602 AQUEOUS no bid . $225.00 . NB

VOLATILES - M 602 Non-Aq no bid . $225.00 . NB

VOLATILES – TCLP $61.00 $95.00 $125.00 . $50.00

Zinc, Dissolved, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $8.00 $4.00

Zinc, Dissolved, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Zinc, ICP . $4.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Zinc, ICPMS . $4.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Zinc, Potable $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Zinc, Potable, ICP $7.00 $15.00 $6.00 . $4.00

Zinc, Potable, ICPMS $7.00 $15.00 $15.00 . $4.00

Rush Markup                1 business day TAT 200 % Surcharge *Dependent 

on prior approval from lab and 

method requirements 100% 200%
                                   3 business day TAT 75 % Surcharge *Dependent on 

prior approval from lab and 

method requirements 50% 100%
                                   5 business day TAT 25 % Surcharge *Dependent on 

prior approval from lab and 

method requirements 20% 50%
                                   7 business day TAT 0 % Surcharge *Dependent on 

prior approval from lab and 

method requirements 0% 25% Yes

Across the board discount off list pricing for related services? 20% 25% NA 0%

Options to renew for additional 12-months

January 1, 2021 through December 31, 2021 Yes Yes Yes Yes

    Maximum Percentage of increase

Options to renew for additional 12-months

January 1, 2022 through December 31, 2022 Yes Yes Yes No

    Maximum Percentage of increase 2%

Options to renew for additional 12-months

January 1, 2023 through December 31, 2023 Yes Yes Yes No

    Maximum Percentage of increase 2%

● = lowest bid     X = vendor selected for award

THE FOLLOWING VENDORS WERE SOLICITED BUT DID NOT BID:

HRC

Dayton, OH 45402

1.  Acculaube/Accurate Lubricants & Metalworking Fluids, Inc. 6.  DM Anderson, Inc. 11.  Ol Corporation

2.  ATC Group Services, Inc. 7.  Hach Company 12.  Prein & Newhof

3.  Belmont Labs 8.  Helix Environmental, Inc. 13.  Teledyne Instruments, Inc.

4.  Bowser-Morner Testing Labs, Inc. 9.  IDEXX Distribution, Inc. 14.  Terracon Consultants, Inc.

5.  Brookside Laboratories, Inc. 10. Occupational Health Ctrs of Ohio, PA 15.  TestAmerica Laboratories, Inc.


