

CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: COMMERCIAL GROUND MAINTENANCE SERVICES

Dept./Div.: VARIOUS

Requisition Nos.: VARIOUS

IFB NO.: 21014D

BID OPENING: 11:30 A.M.; 03-30-2021

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:		No.:	1	2	3	4	5	6
			LONGS'S LAWN CARE	THE GREENSHEARER LLC	BLADECUTTERS INC	HUGELKULTURE LIMITED	LEISURE LAWN OHIO	THE DAVEY TREE EXPERT CO
CITY:			JEFFERSON TOWNSHIP	DAYTON	HARRISON TOWNSHIP	HARRISON TOWNSHIP	WEST CARROLLTON	KENT
STATE & ZIP:			OH 45417	OH 45410	OH 45414	OH 45405	OH 45449	OH 44240
Recommended for Award			X				X	
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?			NO	YES	NO	NO	NO	NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?			YES	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?			NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
Item #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	U/M	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
PLEASE READ ALL BID/PROPOSAL RESPONSES TO ENSURE THAT ALL INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM VENDOR IS REVIEWED AND USED IN EVALUATION PROCESS								
<u>DIVISION OF WATER RECLAMATION</u>								
1	2800 Guthrie Rd							
	Mowing	Lot	\$11,600.00		\$83,200.00		\$2,000.00 Per	\$57,185.00
	Weed Removal and Control	Lot	\$1,000.00		\$3,000.00		\$1,000.00 Bi-monthly	\$3,273.00
	Pruning and Trimming all Trees	Lot	\$1,000.00		\$500.00		\$1,600.00 Per year	\$7,040.00
	Pruning, trimming and shaping all shrubs	Lot	\$500.00		\$2,450.00		\$1,100.00 Per year	\$305.00
	Mulch beds including weed control	Lot	\$2,500.00		\$850.00		\$750.00 Per year	\$680.00
	Planting of annuals	Lot	\$1,500.00		\$150.00		\$350.00 Per year	\$205.00
2	2100 Nicholas Rd							
	Mowing	Lot	\$2,500.00		\$5,320.00		\$350.00 Per	\$3,880.00
	Pruning and Trimming all Trees	Lot	\$1,000.00		\$6,000.00		\$2,100.00 Per year	
3	Danner Ave (Nicholas Rd to Guthrie Rd)							
	Mowing	Lot	\$1,800.00		\$2,315.00		\$200.00 Per	\$2,060.00
	Pruning and Trimming all Trees	Lot	\$900.00		\$500.00		\$10.00 Per	\$10,560.00
4	1725 S. Broadway							
	Mowing	Lot	\$2,600.00	\$150.00	\$2,210.00		\$100.00 Per	\$2,545.00
	Weed Removal and Control	Lot	\$300.00	\$150.00	\$245.00		\$100.00 Per	\$293.00
5	Nicholas Rd/Drydent Rd South Corner							
	Mowing	Lot	\$600.00	\$100.00	\$630.00		\$75.00 Per	\$645.00
	Weed Removal and Control	Lot	\$150.00	\$100.00	\$245.00		\$55.00 Per	Included in mow
6	Nicholas Rd/River Rd South Corner							
	Mowing	Lot	\$400.00	\$100.00	\$490.00		\$50.00 Per	\$415.00
	Weed Removal and Control	Lot	\$150.00	\$100.00	\$245.00		\$30.00 Per	Included in mow
7	River Rd/Guthrie Rd							
	Mowing	Lot	\$1,200.00	\$500.00	\$805.00		\$165.00 Per	\$1,135.00
	Weed Removal and Control	Lot	\$200.00	\$500.00	\$245.00		\$50.00 Per	Included in mow
<u>DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT</u>								
8	Parcel 1 - Abbey Ave/Third St							
	Mowing	Monthly	\$5,500.00		\$4,200.00	\$10,800.00	\$1,220.00 Per	No Bid
9	Parcel 2 - Abbey Ave/ US 35							
	Mowing	Monthly	\$2,300.00		\$3,585.00		\$150.00 Per	No Bid
10	Parcel 3 - S. Upland/Abbey Ave							
	Mowing	Monthly	\$3,200.00		\$4,500.00	\$10,800.00	\$2,570.00 Per	No Bid
11	Parcel 4 - 35 Upper Ave							
	Mowing	Monthly	\$450.00	\$150.00	\$350.00	\$540.00	\$125.00 Per	No Bid
12	Parcel 5 - 1800 McCall St							
	Mowing	Monthly	\$1,850.00	\$150.00	\$165.00	\$2,160.00	\$175.00 Per	No Bid
13	Parcel 6 - 1005 W. Third St							
	Mowing	Monthly	\$800.00	\$150.00	\$595.00	\$540.00	\$125.00 Per	No Bid
14	Parcel 7 - 1440 Wayne Ave							
	Mowing	Monthly	\$550.00	\$150.00	\$385.00	\$810.00	\$150.00 Per	No Bid
Firm Price Agreement Through March 31, 2022 YES / NO			YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
If NO, for how long?								
Options to renew for additional 12-months April 1, 2022 through March 31, 2023 Maximum Percentage of increase			YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Options to renew for additional 12-months April 1, 2023 through March 31, 2024 Maximum Percentage of increase			YES	YES	YES 2.25%	YES	YES	YES
TERMS:			NET 30	5% 10TH PROXIMO	NET 30	NET 30	NET 30	NET 30
F.O.B.:			DEST	DEST	DEST	DEST	DEST	DEST

CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: COMMERCIAL GROUND MAINTENANCE SERVICES

Dept./Div.: VARIOUS

Requisition Nos.: VARIOUS

IFB NO.: 21014D

BID OPENING: 11:30 A.M.; 03-30-2021

No.:		1	2	3	4	5	6
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:		LONGS'S LAWN CARE	THE GREENSHEARER LLC	BLADECUTTERS INC	HUGELKULTURE LIMITED	LEISURE LAWN OHIO	THE DAVEY TREE EXPERT CO
CITY:		JEFFERSON TOWNSHIP	DAYTON	HARRISON TOWNSHIP	HARRISON TOWNSHIP	WEST CARROLLTON	KENT
STATE & ZIP:		OH 45417	OH 45410	OH 45414	OH 45405	OH 45449	OH 44240
Recommended for Award		X				X	
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?		NO	YES	NO	NO	NO	NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?		YES	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?		NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
Item #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	U/M	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
			10 DAYS		30 DAYS	30 DAYS	
DELIVERY:			10 DAYS		30 DAYS	30 DAYS	

• = lowest bid X = vendor selected for award

CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: COMMERCIAL GROUND MAINTENANCE SERVICES

Dept./Div.: VARIOUS

Requisition Nos.: VARIOUS

IFB NO.: 21014D

BID OPENING: 11:30 A.M.; 03-30-2021

No.:		1	2	3	4	5	6
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:		LONGS'S LAWN CARE	THE GREENSHEARER LLC	BLADECUTTERS INC	HUGELKULTURE LIMITED	LEISURE LAWN OHIO	THE DAVEY TREE EXPERT CO
CITY:		JEFFERSON TOWNSHIP	DAYTON	HARRISON TOWNSHIP	HARRISON TOWNSHIP	WEST CARROLLTON	KENT
STATE & ZIP:		OH 45417	OH 45410	OH 45414	OH 45405	OH 45449	OH 44240
Recommended for Award		X				X	
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?		NO	YES	NO	NO	NO	NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?		YES	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?		NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
Item #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	U/M	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST

THE FOLLOWING VENDORS WERE SOLICITED BUT DID NOT BID:

- | | | | |
|---|--|---|--|
| HRC
Dayton OH 45402 | 4. Detail Landscaping & Lawn Care
Dayton OH 45414 | 8. Stripes Lawn Care
Dayton OH 45419 | 11. Green Rhino Landscaping
Fairborn OH 45324 |
| 1. Tree Care Inc (Local)
Dayton OH 45403 | 5. Groundscape Maintenance
Huber Heights OH 45424 | 9. Buckeye EcoCare
Dayton OH 45414 | 12. Turf Nerd Lawn Care LLC
Centerille OH 45459 |
| 2. Sideline Property Management LLC (Local)
Daytoon OH 45401 | 6. Turf Team Lawn Care
Centerville OH 45459 | 10. Turfpoint
Dayton OH 45414 | 13. JB Lawn & Landscaping Inc
Dayton OH 45414 |
| 3. Arbor Experts (Local)
Dayton OH 45404 | 7. Ohio Valley Tree Experts LLC
Dayton OH 45449 | | |