
CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For:  JANITORIAL SLUPPLIES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.:  VARIOUS IFB No.:  21007N

Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened:   2:00 P.M.; 2-5-2021

No.:

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE & ZIP:

Recommended for Award

QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?

QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?

LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?

Item #   ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M

TOLIET TISSUE/PAPER

1

Toilet Paper - White unscented, facial quality, 2-ply, 500 sheets 

per roll       Kimberly Clark #2221, Cascade #674082, AFFEX #538-

2, BCA# 6614235 Or Acceptable Equal CASE/#

●
$29.95 $ $32.77 $39.99 $ $34.00 $35.46 $ $ $ $ $ $32.96 37.36$          $ $ $35.13 $

2

Facial Quality Bath Tissue 500 Sheets/Roll, 2-Ply Vintage 

V25080, Gen800 Or Acceptable Equal (Affex Is Not 

Acceptable.) CASE/# $29.95 $ $34.34 $38.77 $ $34.00 $35.46 $ $ $ $ $ $33.79 ● 22.44$          $ $ $35.13 $

3

Toilet Paper - White, Unscented, facial quality, 2-ply 550 

Sheets Per Roll 100% recycled contents Georgia Pacific 

19880/01 Envision NO SUBSTITUTIONS CASE/# $49.00 $ $49.46 $ $ $48.30 ● $46.18 $ $ $ $ $ $46.30 53.39$          $ $ $46.87 $

x 1.05 Local/Certified Preference Price ● $46.18

4

Toilet Paper - White, Unscented, facial quality, 2-ply toilet 

paper 605 Sheets per Roll    Kimberly Clark 64460 or 

Acceptable Equal CASE/# $49.00 $ $39.40 $ $ $ $52.88 $ $ $ $ $ ● $32.96 62.31$          $ $ $44.20 $

5

Toilet Paper - White, Unscented, 2-ply, core-less 1150 Sheets 

Per Roll    Must fit Baywest and/or Kimberly Clark Dispensers CASE/# $32.80 $ NO Bid $ $ $ $61.91 $ $ $ $ $ $46.51 ● 25.48$          $ $ $49.65 $

6

Toilet Paper – Jumbo Roll, 2-ply, 3.5” width – non-perforated 

Georgia Pacific Acclaim 13728 or Acceptable Equal Product 

must fit dispenser CASE/# $32.80 $ $26.63 $21.77 $ $27.62 $27.68 $ $ $ $ $ ● $21.75 31.68$          $ $ $27.38 $

7

Toilet Paper – Double-Soft 2 ply 625  (BC3003625)  or 

Acceptable Equal Product CASE/# $55.00 $ $32.77 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $38.95 ● 22.44$          $ $ $ $

PAPER PRODUCTS - OTHER

8

White, 1 ply C-fold paper towel 200 Towels per Pkg 100% 

Recycled Content  Bay West 48300, EcoSoft Green Seal 

Certified, Bobrick or acceptable equal CASE/# ● $16.50 $ $21.20 $18.77 $ $18.25 $18.88 $ $ $ $ $ $17.75 33.14$          $ $ $16.68 $

9

Natural, 1 Ply C-Fold Paper Towel 10.25” x 13.25” 240 Towels 

per Pkg  100% Recycled Content  Georgia Pacific 21924 

Envision or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $19.50 $ $30.36 ● $15.30 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $17.75 33.14$          $ $ $29.56 $

10

White, 1 Ply C-Fold Paper Towel NIBROC 55341 or 

Acceptable Equal – (Encore 4814 does not fit dispenser) CASE/# ● $16.50 $ $21.20 $18.77 $ $18.25 $18.88 $ $ $ $ $ $17.75 22.51$          $ $ $ $

11

White, premium Z-Fold Paper Towels Georgia Pacific Big Fold 

# 20887 or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $27.00 $ $21.20 $ $ $42.15 $39.83 $ $ $ $ $ ● $16.85 46.47$          $ $ $40.43 $

12

Brown Multi-fold Z-Fold Paper Towels Fort Howard # 5280 or 

Acceptable Equal CASE/# $19.50 $ No Bid $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $16.25 16.50$          $ $ $16.67 $

13 Natural Towels, non-perforated 8” x 8” x 800’ – with core CASE/# $19.07 $ $22.92 $18.99 $ $17.60 $20.04 $ $ $ $ $ $19.04 36.44$          $ $ $19.44 $

x 1.05 Local/Certified Preference Price ● $17.60

14 Natural Towels, non-perforated 8”W x 1000’L with core CASE/# NO BID $ ● $22.93 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $29.58 36.44$          $ $ $ $

15 White Towels, non-perforated 8” x 8” x 800’ with core CASE/# $22.95 $ $27.63 ● $19.33 $ $22.15 $25.67 $ $ $ $ $ $20.18 68.71$          $ $ $25.57 $

16

All purpose wiper, Center-pull, 2 rolls to box, 300 feet per roll, 

white, Kimberly Clark 005820 or Acceptable equal. CASE/# $58.00 $ $76.01 $ $ $55.13 $50.69 $ $ $ $ $
●

$22.08 89.53$          $57.89 $ $61.48 $

17

Brown Roll Paper Towels 6/800 cut Nittany Paper NP-6800 

YN or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $28.60
●

$17.83 $30.00 $20.04 $19.04 $25.57

18

 Georgia Pacific #26495 Pacific Blue Ultra NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS CASE/# $72.50 $ $69.51 $ ● $56.05 $ $64.19 $ $ $ $ $ $61.00 75.51$          $ $ $65.15 $

PAPER PRODUCTS - OTHER

19

Feminine Hygiene Liner – Waxed Paper, 9” x 10” x 3.25 

Hospeco HS-6141 NO SUBSTITUTIONS CASE/# $23.60 $ $16.02 $ $
●

$14.63 $ $ $ $ $ $16.40 17.82$          $15.98 $ $15.70 $

20

Feminine Hygiene Sanitary products Disposable Bags – Size:  

17”x17” Color:  brown 1000/cs CASE/# $24.00 $
●

$15.39 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $35.00 $71.99 $ $ $

21

Toilet seat covers, Half fold, Sanitary Paper Flushable Seat 

Covers (½ fold) minimum weight acceptable (1,000 = 5.5lbs., 

2,500 = 16lbs., 5,000= 31lbs.) Hospeco Health Gards 

Recycled Toilet Seat Covers or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $32.10 $ $32.36 $ $ $39.90 ● $25.07 $ $ $ $ $ $28.35 36.96$          $39.98 $ $38.74 $

TRASH CAN LINERS

22

High Density, Perforated Rolls - 24” x 24” 11 Micron or thicker 

– Color:  Clear CASE/# $19.35 $23.02 $40.43
●

$11.30 $ $22.57 $12.01 $10.98 $8.82 ● $6.84 ● $6.84 ● $6.84 $14.62 $ $ $32.67 $

23

High Density, Perforated Rolls - 24” x 33” 11 Micron or thicker 

– Color:  Black CASE/# $26.00 $26.38 $40.43 $12.70 $ $14.72 $11.34 ● $8.34 ● $8.34 ● $8.34 $15.57 $ $ $32.67 $

24

High Density, Perforated Rolls - 30” x 37” 10 Micron or thicker 

(Extra Extra Heavy) – Color: Clear CASE/# $22.00 $18.48 $22.97 $13.00 $ $19.65 $17.48 $14.72 ● $14.72 ● $14.72 ● $14.72 $16.76 19.57$          $ $ $18.55 $

25

Linear Low Density, Perforated Rolls - 33” x 40” 1.35 Mil or 

thicker (Extra Extra Heavy) – Color: Clear/Natural CASE/# $17.70 ● $11.42 $20.08 $12.40 $ $15.55 $15.04 $32.24 $29.34 $22.72 $16.48 ● $10.82 $12.50 $ $ $16.52 $

26

High Density, Perforated Rolls - 33” x 40” – 33 Gallon 17 

Micron or thicker (Extra Extra Heavy) – Color: Natural CASE/# $22.50 $11.42 $20.80 $13.80 $ $16.82 $25.78 $17.82 $14.72 $12.84 ● $11.24 ● $11.24 $16.90 20.42$          $ $ $17.43 $

27

High Density, Perforated Rolls - 33” x 40” 22 Micron or thicker 

(Extra Extra Heavy) – Color: Natural CASE/# $28.72 ● $11.86 $23.18 $14.50 $ $25.78 $22.68 $20.48 $18.82 $15.34 $12.82 $22.03 32.43$          $ $ $19.42 $

28

Linear Low Density, Perforated Rolls - 33” x 40” 1.35 Mil or 

thicker (Extra Extra Heavy) – Color: Black CASE/# $16.70 $8.33 $21.90 $11.10 $ $12.93 $21.48 $10.82 $9.98 $8.72 $7.34 ● $6.32 $12.50 15.68$          $ $ $13.15 $
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Linear Low Density, Perforated Rolls 43" x 47" 1.35 Mil or 

thicker (Extra Extra Heavy) – Color:  Black CASE/# $21.82 $12.77 $22.94 $14.70 $ $19.80 $21.61 $16.82 $15.68 $14.48 $11.34 ● $9.84 $18.05 22.38$          $ $ $19.53 $

30

Linear Low Density, Perforated Rolls 43" x 47" 1.35 Mil or 

thicker (Extra Extra Heavy) – Color:  Black CASE/# $21.82 $17.50 $22.94 $14.70 $ $19.80 $21.61 $20.48 $18.84 $14.98 $11.82 ● $10.24 $18.05 14.93$          $ $ $19.53 $

31

Linear Low Density, Perforated Rolls 43" x 47" 2.0 Mil or 

thicker (Extra Extra Heavy) – Color:  Black CASE/# $25.60 $15.72 $31.91 $19.50 $ $27.33 $23.72 $21.48 $18.24 ● $16.92 ● $16.92 $26.68 $ $ $27.13 $

32

High Density, Perforated Rolls - 43” x 48”   2 Mil or thicker 

(Extra Extra Heavy) – Color:  Black CASE/# $25.60 $16.05 $31.91 $20.00 $ $30.87 $21.74 $23.98 $21.72 $19.98 $17.34 ● $15.48 $27.24 29.82$          $ $ $27.13 $

33

High Density, Perforated Rolls - 44 x 45” 2 Mil or thicker (Extra 

Extra Heavy) - Color:  Black CASE/# $35.00 ● $15.40 $30.63 $23.00 $ $ $23.72 $21.74 $19.82 $17.24 $17.24 $26.13 29.82$          $ $ $26.05 $

34

Trash Liner 60 Gallon 38” x 60” 2.0 Mil or thicker (Extra Extra 

Heavy) – Color:  Black CASE/# $29.09 $17.73 $16.61 $18.77 $ $34.13 $28.14 $26.82 $23.74 $21.82 $18.32 ● $16.34 $29.15 32.54$          $ $ $14.14 $

FLOOR CLEANING PRODUCTS

Across the board discount off % or markup of % above 

pricing for products and related supplies not listed herein % % % % %

●
% % % % % % 50% discount off catalog list 15% % % %

35

White Mop Heads w/ 1” Headband looped ends and sewn at 

bottom – material:  cotton

Small CASE $59.04 $ $29.35 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $26.28 ● 5.93$            $34.68 $ $40.88 $

Medium CASE $59.04 $ $36.25 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $26.28 9.06$            $45.48 $ $48.59 $

Large CASE $59.04 $ $34.35 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $36.69 9.06$            $47.88 $ $58.15 $

36

White Mop Heads w/ 1” Headband looped ends – material:  

cotton

Small CASE $59.04 $ $29.34 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $26.28 1.83$            $35.88 $ $40.89 $

Medium CASE $59.04 $ $36.25 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $26.28 2.64$            $36.60 $ $48.59 $

Large CASE $59.04 $ $48.10 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $36.69 5.93$            $45.48 $ $58.15 $

37 White Mop Heads w/ 1” Headband cut end – material:  cotton

Small CASE $48.00 $ $25.35 $ $ $ $35.88 $ $ $ $ $ ● $17.16 ● 2.38$            $23.88 $ $23.55 $

Medium CASE $48.00 $ $27.18 $ $ $ $42.12 $ $ $ $ $ ● $21.78 ● 2.54$            $27.28 $ $29.45 $

Large CASE $48.00 $ $33.85 $ $ $ $52.08 $ $ $ $ $ ● $26.82 ● 3.89$            $34.68 $ $41.23 $

38 Mop Head-Looped; Blue; 4PLY; Synthetic Blend $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

Small CASE $59.04 $ $29.35 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $25.74 ● 3.20$            $33.48 $ $44.02 $

Medium CASE $69.04 $ $34.91 $ $ $ $28.50 $ $ $ $ $ $31.58 ● 10.83$          $39.48 $ $54.47 $

Large CASE $79.04 $ $46.36 $ $ $ $34.56 $ $ $ $ $ $43.38 ● 5.07$            $51.48 $ $65.51 $

39 Mop Head-waxing 24 oz $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

Small CASE $65.00 $ $29.64 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $29.12 ● 2.09$            $45.48 $ $44.02 $

Medium CASE $75.00 $ ● $35.57 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $37.46 52.79$          $45.48 $ $54.47 $

Large CASE $85.00 $ $41.65 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $45.93 ● 2.97$            $56.28 $ $65.51 $

40 Mop Head-waxing Blue-head

Small CASE $65.00 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $29.12 ● 4.74$            $45.48 $ $44.02 $

Medium CASE $75.00 $ $54.65 $ $ $ $32.04 $ $ $ $ $ $37.46 ● 3.83$            $45.48 $ $54.47 $

Large CASE $85.00 $ $72.25 $ $ $ $37.50 $ $ $ $ $ $45.93 ● 3.50$            $56.28 $ $65.51 $

41

20 oz. (Poly Wrapped) Mop Head With 1" Head Band 

Approximately 5 Inches in Width, High Quality 4 Ply Twisted 

Cotton Yarn, Cut Ends VINING #2320 or Acceptable Equal NO BID

Small CASE NO BID $ $25.31 $ $ $ $32.76 $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 2.12$            $ $ $ $

Medium CASE NO BID $ $31.09 $ $ $ $38.16 $ $ $ $ $ $26.82 ● 2.54$            $ $ $34.60 $

Large CASE NO BID $ $35.85 $ $ $ $39.00 $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 2.97$            $ $ $36.07 $

42

Mop Heads Looped Ends For Wax, With 1" Head Band and 5 

Inches in Width, High Quality 4 Ply Twisted Cotton Yarn

Small CASE $65.00 $ $62.21 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $34.50 ● 4.55$            $ $ $23.56 $

Medium CASE $75.00 $ $78.92 $ $ $ $32.04 $ $ $ $ $ $28.87 ● 5.93$            $ $ $29.45 $

Large CASE $85.00 ● $ $91.96 $ $ $ $37.50 $ $ $ $ $ $40.50 ● 5.93$            $ $ $41.22 $

43

Mop Handle, Wood, 63" Quick Change #83OC ZEPHR 

#16189 or Acceptable Equal EACH $8.25 $ $80.08 $ $ $ $9.75 $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.15 6.13$            $ $ $ $

CASE $99.00 $ $ $ $ $ $117.00 $ $ $ $ $ ● $30.93 $63.48 $ $95.70 $

44 Mop Bucket with ringer – Size:  5 Gallon EACH $105.60 $ $54.28 $ $ $ $58.15 $ $ $ $ $ ● $35.98 70.28$          $52.95 $ $48.37 $

CASE $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

45

Lobby Toy Broom, 33" long total, wood handle, corn bristle 

fibers, for spot sweeping EACH $4.53 $ $23.85 $ $ $ $4.51 $ $ $ $ $ $2.81 ● 2.66$            $ $ $

CASE $54.36 $ $ $ $ $ $54.12 $ $ $ $ $ ● $33.72 $39.48 $ $39.01 $

46 Lobby Broom- approx. 36"Hx8"x1-1/2" EACH NO BID $ $79.75 $ $ $ $4.51 $ $ $ $ $ ● $2.19 2.66$            $ $ $4.86 $

2
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47 Lobby Broom – Plastic – broom only EACH $7.95 $ $4.06 $ $ $ ● $3.49 $ $ $ $ $ $4.18 5.03$            $ $ $ $

CASE $47.70 $ ● $4.89 $ $ $ $20.94 $ $ $ $ $ $49.16 $30.84 $ $55.95 $

48 Angle Broom 13" width, standard, approx. 60” non-wood handle  EACH $12.60 $ $6.07 $ $ $ $5.60 $ $ $ $ $ $3.89 ● 3.58$            $ $ $ $

CASE $50.40 $ $72.87 $ $ $ $33.60 $ $ $ $ $ $46.73 $46.68 $ ● $30.55 $

49 Warehouse Broom, Industrial Quality Corn Broom, Corn Fiber  

Bristles Reinforced With Heavy Wire Band And With Four 

Rows 

 of Stitching, Straight Smooth Hard Handle

EACH $13.50 $ $6.73 $ $ $ $11.95 $ $ $ $ $ ● $6.70 6.82$            $ $ $ $

CASE $108.00 $ $80.82 $ $ $ $143.40 $ $ $ $ $ ● $40.20 $69.48 $ $47.85 $

50

Street Broom Head 3-1/2" Wide Hardwood Block with 

 Two Tapered Handle Holes; 5-1/4" Trim, 5 Rows of African EACH NO BID $ $10.49 $ $ $ $7.68 $ $ $ $ $ ● $6.63 81.03$          $ $ $ $

CASE NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $92.16 $ $ $ $ $ ● $39.78 $71.76 $ $ $

51

Street Broom Handle 60" X 1 1/8", wood, plain sanded finish 

with tapered ends EACH $4.98 $ $3.55 $ $ $ $3.89 $ $ $ $ $
●

$2.21 2.59$            $ $ $ $

CASE $59.76 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $26.54 $33.48 $ $49.33 $

52 Double Stitched, Whisk Broom. Small Car Broom EACH $2.97 $ ● $1.82 $ $ $ $5.20 $ $ $ $ $ $2.12 $ $ $ $

CASE $35.64 $ ● $22.09 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $25.50 $31.08 $ $32.39 $

53

Floor Brush HEAD. Natural Lacquered Hardwood Blocks With 

2 Threaded Handle Holes. Heavily Filled With Select Black 

Tampico Fiber Center With Border of Stiff Black Horsehair, 

Trimmed 3" Out of Block. Wright Bernet #7818 or Acceptable 

Equal EACH

NO BID

$ $11.37 $ $ $ $28.87 $ $ $ $ $ $9.98 ● 5.14$            $ $ $ $

CASE NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $59.88 $64.68 $ $ $

54 Floor Brush Handle with Treaded Ends. Natural 60' X 15/16" Laquered FinishEACH $2.98 $ $3.08 $ $ $ $2.94 $ $ $ $ $ ● $2.30 2.38$            $ $ $ $

CASE $35.76 $ $ $ $ $ $35.28 $ $ $ $ $ $27.63 ● $26.28 $ $35.05 $

55

Smooth Finished Hardwood Block Brush 7-1/4" X 2-3/8" With 

4 X 12 Rows of 1" White Tampico EACH NO BID $ $76.15 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $4.85 ● 2.31$            $ $ $ $

CASE NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $58.20 ● $37.08 $ $52.71 $

56

Lobby Dustpan, Plastic 5-3/4" X 12" X 36-5/8" Rubbermaid  

#2007 or Acceptable Equal EACH $10.50 $ $76.15 $ $ $ $8.96 $ $ $ $ $ $6.64 16.53$          $10.99 $ ● $2.32 $

CASE $63.00 $ $ $ $ $ $53.76 $ $ $ $ $ $132.80 $53.94 $ ● $27.74 $

57 Stripping Pads - Black

12" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ ● $2.48 $ $ $ $ $ $ 3.38$            $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $12.40 $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.95 $6.99 $ $6.35 $

16" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 5.06$            $ $ $ $

CASE $13.50 $ $11.17 $ $ $ $10.29 $ $ $ $ $ $9.21 ● $8.99 $ $9.45 $

20" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 16.52$          $ $ $ $

CASE $22.50 $ $15.61 $ $ $ $14.16 $ $ $ $ $ ● $11.95 $11.98 $ $13.21 $

58 Stripping Pads - Brown

12" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 3.38$            $ $ $ $

CASE NO BID $ $7.50 $ $ $ $12.91 $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.95 $6.99 $ $6.35 $

16" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 5.06$            $ $ $ $

CASE NO BID $ $11.17 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $9.21 ● $8.99 $ $9.45 $

20" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 22.85$          $ $ $ $

CASE NO BID $ $15.61 $ $ $ $30.85 $ $ $ $ $ ● $11.95 $11.98 $ $13.21 $

59 Cleaning Pads - Blue

8" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 2.15$            $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ ● $7.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

12" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 3.28$            $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $12.01 $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.95 $6.99 $ $6.35 $

16" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 4.93$            $ $ $ $

CASE $13.50 $ $11.17 $ $ $ $10.16 $ $ $ $ $ $9.21 ● $8.99 $ $9.45 $

20" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 7.06$            $ $ $ $

CASE $22.50 $ $15.61 $ $ $ $14.16 $ $ $ $ $ ● $11.95 $11.98 $ $13.21 $

60 Pre-Burnish Pads - Green

8" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ ● $7.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

12" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 8.68$            $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $6.85 $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.95 $6.99 $ $6.59 $

16" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 30.25$          $ $ $ $

CASE $13.50 $ $11.17 $ $ $ $10.09 $ $ $ $ $ $9.21 ● $8.99 $ $9.63 $

20" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 19.79$          $ $ $ $
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CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For:  JANITORIAL SLUPPLIES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.:  VARIOUS IFB No.:  21007N

Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened:   2:00 P.M.; 2-5-2021

No.:

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE & ZIP:

Recommended for Award

QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?

QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?

LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?

Item #   ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M

16

ZEP

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

15

WORK SMART

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

14

UNIPAK

CORP

BROOKLYN

NY 11230

NO

NO

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

X

NO

NO

13

STATE 

INDUSTRIAL

PRODUCTS CORP

MAYFIELD HTS

OH 44124

NO

NO

9E

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

Key-4

Cleaning 

Supplies

OH 43228

9A

CORP

X

9C

PACKAGING

9B

NY  12549

MONTGOMERY

X X

INTERBORO

12

PYRAMID

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

NO NO

INTERBORO INTERBORO

PACKAGING PACKAGING

CORP CORP

MONTGOMERY MONTGOMERY

NY  12549 NY  12549

Columbus

9D

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

10

YES NO NO NO

DAYTON PISCATAWAY Columbus LINDEN

HILLSIDE MAINTENANCE

NO NO

ROBY SERVICES ALL AMERICAN CARMEN'S CENTRAL POLY GLOBECOM

INC.

LTD dba ROBY POLY DISTRIBUTION BAG CORP TECHNOLOGIES SUPPLY CO

X
NJ  07036

SUPPLY SYSTEMS, INC.

CANAL FULTON

2 3

INDIANAPOLIS

X X
OH  45403 NJ  08854 OH 43213 OH 44614 OH 45225

7

IN 46268

CINCINNATI

4 5 61

HP PRODUCTS

FERGUSON FACILITIES

CORP dba

NO NO

NONO NO NOYES NO NO NO NO NO

11

MRO

EXPRESS

LLC

CINCINNATI

OH  45246

X

NO

NO

CASE $22.50 $ $15.61 $ $ $ $14.16 $ $ $ $ $ $11.95 ● $11.89 $ $1,346.00 $
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CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For:  JANITORIAL SLUPPLIES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.:  VARIOUS IFB No.:  21007N

Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened:   2:00 P.M.; 2-5-2021

No.:

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE & ZIP:

Recommended for Award

QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?

QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?

LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?

Item #   ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M

16

ZEP

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

15

WORK SMART

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

14

UNIPAK

CORP

BROOKLYN

NY 11230

NO

NO

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

X

NO

NO

13

STATE 

INDUSTRIAL

PRODUCTS CORP

MAYFIELD HTS

OH 44124

NO

NO

9E

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

Key-4

Cleaning 

Supplies

OH 43228

9A

CORP

X

9C

PACKAGING

9B

NY  12549

MONTGOMERY

X X

INTERBORO

12

PYRAMID

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

NO NO

INTERBORO INTERBORO

PACKAGING PACKAGING

CORP CORP

MONTGOMERY MONTGOMERY

NY  12549 NY  12549

Columbus

9D

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

10

YES NO NO NO

DAYTON PISCATAWAY Columbus LINDEN

HILLSIDE MAINTENANCE

NO NO

ROBY SERVICES ALL AMERICAN CARMEN'S CENTRAL POLY GLOBECOM

INC.

LTD dba ROBY POLY DISTRIBUTION BAG CORP TECHNOLOGIES SUPPLY CO

X
NJ  07036

SUPPLY SYSTEMS, INC.

CANAL FULTON

2 3

INDIANAPOLIS

X X
OH  45403 NJ  08854 OH 43213 OH 44614 OH 45225

7

IN 46268

CINCINNATI

4 5 61

HP PRODUCTS

FERGUSON FACILITIES

CORP dba

NO NO

NONO NO NOYES NO NO NO NO NO

11

MRO

EXPRESS

LLC

CINCINNATI

OH  45246

X

NO

NO

61 Buffing Pads - Red

8" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 30.88$          $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.01 $

12" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 3.28$            $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $6.55 $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.95 $6.99 $ $6.35 $

16" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 4.93$            $ $ $ $

CASE $13.50 $ $11.17 $ $ $ $10.09 $ $ $ $ $ $9.21 ● $8.99 $ $9.45 $

20" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 16.52$          $ $ $ $

CASE $22.50 $ $15.61 $ $ $ $14.16 $ $ $ $ $ $11.95 ● $11.89 $ $13.20 $

62 Buffing Pads - White

 8" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

 CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.01 $

 12" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 3.06$            $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $6.55 $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.95 $6.99 $ $6.35 $

16" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 27.27$          $ $ $ $

CASE $13.50 $ $11.17 $ $ $ $10.16 $ $ $ $ $ $9.21 ● $8.99 $ $9.45 $

20" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 35.29$          $ $ $ $

CASE $22.50 $ $15.61 $ $ $ $14.16 $ $ $ $ $ ● $11.95 $11.98 $ $13.20 $

63 Buffing Pads 12" Natural Blend White-White boar hairs bristle 

8" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ ● $7.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

12" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 3.06$            $ $ $ $

CASE $9.70 $ $7.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.95 $6.99 $ $6.59 $

16" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 3.06$            $ $ $ $

CASE $13.50 $ $11.17 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $9.21 ● $8.99 $ $9.63 $

20" EACH NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 35.29$          $ $ $ $

CASE $22.50 $ $15.91 $ $ $ $14.18 $ $ $ $ $ $11.95 ● $11.89 $ $13.46 $

64 Buffing Bonnets CASE $245.00 $ $105.75 $ $ $ $121.69 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $13.64 $

65 Yarn Bonnets 21" for carpet cleaning CASE $39.50 $ $105.75 $ $ $ $104.05 $ $ $ $ $ $49.08 ● 15.99$          $104.95 $ $61.45 $

66 Floor Scraper 8” blade with adjustable (extendable) handle EACH NO BID $ $47.69 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $34.67 ● 31.96$          $ $ $35.89 $

CASE $77.80 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $69.35 $ $ $ $

67 Floor Scraper 8” replacement blades EACH ● 2.95 10.55 49.25 8.82$            23.31

68 Floor Squeegee 8” blade with handle EACH NO BID $53.01 $12.25 ● 2.35$            

CASE NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $12.25 $ $ $ $

69 Floor Squeegee 8” replacement blades CASE ● $2.95 $ 10.55 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $6.25 8.82$            $ $ $ $

70 Floor squeegees  with Tapered Handle Holes 60”  42 EACH NO BID $ $53.01 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $6.35 ● 8.48$            $11.99 $ $ $

CASE NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $6.35 $65.94 $ $ $

71

Neutral Floor Cleaner for non-finished floors – Size:  Gallon                        

Zep Bio Swab or Acceptable Equal CASE
$37.50 $ ● $20.15 $ $ $28.75 $25.04 $ $ $ $ $ $22.15

45.41$          
$ $99.00 $48.54 $

72

“Green” Floor Finish Remover – Size:  5 Gallons Must be 

Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE
$180.00 $ $80.06 $ $ $ $72.99 $ $ $ $ $ ● $72.18 $ $99.00 $ $

73

“Green” Floor Finish – Size:  5 Gallons Must be Green Seal or 

Ecologo Certified CASE
$210.00 $ $62.65 $ $ $ $73.69 $ $ $ $ $ ● $62.04 $ $85.00 $ $

74 Floor Wax - Multi-purpose to use on tile, wood or cement floors CASE $49.00 $ $69.50 $ $ $60.24 $ $ $ $ $ $ $45.17 ● 16.39$          $ $ $50.61 $47.21

75 Floor Stripper – Multi-purpose to use on tile, wood or cement floorsCASE $59.00 $ $59.13 $ $ $58.35 $ $ $ $ $ $ $31.50 ● 12.32$          $ $65.00 $50.64 $53.48

76

Carpet pre-spray, Heavy Duty – Size 1.5L  Johnson RTD or 

Acceptable Equal Must be Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE NO BID $ $28.60 $ $ $56.75 $70.41 $ $ $ $ $ ● $27.45 $ $ $71.35

77

Carpet Spotting Solution – Size:  Quart Spartan Contempo or 

Acceptable Equal Must be Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE $40.00 $ $31.66 $ $ $71.82 ● $26.58 $ $ $ $ $ $28.44 198.55$        $ $ $69.15

78

Carpet Shampoo for use in hot/cold extractors - Size:  Gallon 

Spartan Xtraction II or Acceptable Equal CASE $38.50 $ $41.22 $ $ $54.54 $28.56 $ $ $ $ $ $35.14 ● 14.02$          $ $99.00 $35.62

79

Carpet Cleaner:  Spartan Bonnet & Traffic Lane Carpet 

Cleaner or Acceptable Equal CASE $69.50 $ $28.60 $ $ $56.75 $58.31 $ $ $ $ $ $35.25 ● 11.13$          $ $ $33.19

80 Defoamer for carpet extractors CASE $46.00 $ $46.75 $ $ $75.10 $70.43 $ $ $ $ $ $41.48 ● 13.94$          $ $ $51.28 $55.00

81 Carpet Extraction Cleaner – Size:  Gallon CASE $38.00 $ $41.22 $ $ $54.54 $28.56 $ $ $ $ $ $39.34 ● 12.81$          $ $99.00 $35.93

82

Neutral no rinse floor cleaner concentrate: Damp Mop 

Detergent Concentrate or Acceptable Equal CASE $26.50 $ ● $20.15 $ $ $28.75 $25.04 $ $ $ $ $ $22.15 52.44$          $ $99.00 $26.97 $41.21

83 Foaming carpet spot and upholstery cleaner CASE $33.00 $ $28.60 $ $ $ $40.08 $ $ $ $ $ $24.73 ● 3.00$            $ $99.00 $34.20 $54.00

84 Floor Dry, Absorbent.  Eagle Pritcher or Acceptable Equal CASE $12.50 $ $18.09 $ $ $ $6.22 $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 5.67$            $ $ $12.55

85

H P Sweeping Compound For Wood & Concrete Floor, Color 

Red, 100 Pound Boxes CASE
NO BID $

● $18.09
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

$24.58 35.30$          
$ $ $

86

All Purpose Clay Absorbent, 50lb Poly Bags SafeTSorb 

Premium Oil Absorbent or Acceptable Equal CASE
$12.50 $ $13.45 $ $ $ $7.67 $ $ $ $ $

● 5.67$            
$ $

$7.25

87

Absorbent Pads 15” x 19”  (100/Case) For Petroleum-based 

oils, solvents and other non-water soluble liquids SPC OP100 

or Acceptable Equal CASE NO BID $ $59.97 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $46.80 43.79$          $ $ ● $26.76

88

Absorbent Pads 15” x 19” (200/Case) For All Fluids (Water, 

Petroleum, and Chemical Based) SPC GP200 or Acceptable 

Equal CASE NO BID $ $40.75 $ $ $ $49.35 $ $ $ $ $ $62.04 72.78$          $ $ ● $30.67 $
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CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For:  JANITORIAL SLUPPLIES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.:  VARIOUS IFB No.:  21007N

Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened:   2:00 P.M.; 2-5-2021

No.:

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE & ZIP:

Recommended for Award

QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?

QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?

LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?

Item #   ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M

16

ZEP

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

15

WORK SMART

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

14

UNIPAK

CORP

BROOKLYN

NY 11230

NO

NO

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

X

NO

NO

13

STATE 

INDUSTRIAL

PRODUCTS CORP

MAYFIELD HTS

OH 44124

NO

NO

9E

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

Key-4

Cleaning 

Supplies

OH 43228

9A

CORP

X

9C

PACKAGING

9B

NY  12549

MONTGOMERY

X X

INTERBORO

12

PYRAMID

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

NO NO

INTERBORO INTERBORO

PACKAGING PACKAGING

CORP CORP

MONTGOMERY MONTGOMERY

NY  12549 NY  12549

Columbus

9D

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

10

YES NO NO NO

DAYTON PISCATAWAY Columbus LINDEN

HILLSIDE MAINTENANCE

NO NO

ROBY SERVICES ALL AMERICAN CARMEN'S CENTRAL POLY GLOBECOM

INC.

LTD dba ROBY POLY DISTRIBUTION BAG CORP TECHNOLOGIES SUPPLY CO

X
NJ  07036

SUPPLY SYSTEMS, INC.

CANAL FULTON

2 3

INDIANAPOLIS

X X
OH  45403 NJ  08854 OH 43213 OH 44614 OH 45225

7

IN 46268

CINCINNATI

4 5 61

HP PRODUCTS

FERGUSON FACILITIES

CORP dba

NO NO

NONO NO NOYES NO NO NO NO NO

11

MRO

EXPRESS

LLC

CINCINNATI

OH  45246

X

NO

NO

89

Absorbent Pads 30’ x 30’ (50/Case) For Petroleum-based oils, 

solvents and other non-water soluble liquids SPC MRO50 or 

Acceptable Equal CASE NO BID $ $100.01 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $99.00 ● 68.25$          $ $ $69.85 $
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CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For:  JANITORIAL SLUPPLIES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.:  VARIOUS IFB No.:  21007N

Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened:   2:00 P.M.; 2-5-2021

No.:

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE & ZIP:

Recommended for Award

QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?

QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?

LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?

Item #   ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M

16

ZEP

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

15

WORK SMART
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FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

14

UNIPAK

CORP

BROOKLYN

NY 11230

NO

NO

FINDLAY

OH  45840

NO

NO

X

NO

NO

13

STATE 

INDUSTRIAL

PRODUCTS CORP

MAYFIELD HTS

OH 44124

NO

NO

9E

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

Key-4

Cleaning 

Supplies

OH 43228

9A

CORP

X

9C

PACKAGING

9B

NY  12549

MONTGOMERY

X X

INTERBORO

12

PYRAMID

OFFICE 

FURNISHING

NO NO

INTERBORO INTERBORO

PACKAGING PACKAGING

CORP CORP

MONTGOMERY MONTGOMERY

NY  12549 NY  12549

Columbus

9D

INTERBORO

PACKAGING

CORP

MONTGOMERY

NY  12549

X

NO

NO

10

YES NO NO NO

DAYTON PISCATAWAY Columbus LINDEN

HILLSIDE MAINTENANCE

NO NO

ROBY SERVICES ALL AMERICAN CARMEN'S CENTRAL POLY GLOBECOM

INC.

LTD dba ROBY POLY DISTRIBUTION BAG CORP TECHNOLOGIES SUPPLY CO

X
NJ  07036

SUPPLY SYSTEMS, INC.

CANAL FULTON

2 3

INDIANAPOLIS

X X
OH  45403 NJ  08854 OH 43213 OH 44614 OH 45225

7

IN 46268

CINCINNATI

4 5 61

HP PRODUCTS

FERGUSON FACILITIES

CORP dba

NO NO

NONO NO NOYES NO NO NO NO NO

11

MRO

EXPRESS

LLC

CINCINNATI

OH  45246

X

NO

NO

90

Absorbent Roll 15” x 150’  (1/Case)  For Petroleum-based oils, 

solvents and other non-water soluble liquids SPC OP15P or 

Acceptable Equal CASE NO BID $ $106.69 $ $ $ $75.09 $ $ $ $ $ $48.50 ● 51.21$          $ $ $55.31 $

91

Absorbent Booms 5” x 10’ (4/Case) For oil and petroleum 

based fluids SPC ENV510 or Acceptable Equal CASE NO BID $ $58.60 $ $ $ $65.90 $ $ $ $ $ $54.52 ● 51.80$          $ $ $53.98 $

92

Absorbent Boom 3” x 4’ (30/Case) All Purpose Poly-Propylene 

SPC AW430 or Acceptable Equal CASE NO BID $ $58.67 $ $ $ ● $55.64 $ $ $ $ $ $98.98 60.04$          $ $ $63.80 $

93

Absorbent Booms 3” x 12’  (4/Case) For oil and petroleum only 

(Does not absorb water) SPC OIL124 or Acceptable Equal CASE NO BID $ $69.03 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $59.13 33.03$          $ $ ● $22.64 $

BATHROOM/TOILET/URINAL PRODUCTS (MSDS SHEETS 

)

94

Tub and Tile Cleaner- Johnson Diversey Crew or Acceptable 

Equal

  CASE/# $30.00 $ $59.55 $ $ $ $20.43 $ $ $ $ $ ● $18.32 20.50$          $ $85.00 $31.87 $85.00

95

Bath & All Surface Cleaner – Size:  Quart Spartan Peroxy II 

FBC or Acceptable Equal Must be Green Seal or Ecologo CASE/# $29.00 $ $45.95 $ $ $0.79 $28.60 $ $ $ $ $ $26.48 42.01$          $ $150.00 ● $20.12 $

96

Restroom cleaner – Size:  2 Liter Spartan Consume Eco-lyzer 

Biotransport 1 or Acceptable Equal  Must be Green Seal or CASE/# NO BID $ $67.05 $ $ ● $0.79 $47.69 $ $ $ $ $ $42.52 12.77$          $ $ $62.03 $

97

Restroom cleaner – Size:  Gallon Spartan Consume Eco-lyzer 

Biotransport 1 or Acceptable Equal Must be Green Seal or 

Ecologo Certified CASE/# $37.00 $ $44.30 $ $ ● $0.79 $48.06 $ $ $ $ $ $42.52 61.61$          $ $150.00 $48.54 $

98

Restroom cleaner – Size:  Quart Spartan Green Solutions or 

Acceptable Equal  Must be Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/# $29.00 $ $36.36 $ $ ● $0.79 $30.30 $ $ $ $ $ $26.48 4.41$            $ $ $24.33 $

99 Deodorizer urinal screen Wave  or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $22.50 $ $16.81 $ $ $102.70 $156.60 $ $ $ $ $ ● $9.15 16.69$          $109.98 $90.00 $10.72 $

100
Urinal Screen With Deodorant, Permeated for Order Control. 

One Size Fits All CASE/# $22.50 $ $16.16 $ $ $ $16.68 $ $ $ $ $ ● $11.50 16.69$          $34.50 $49.00 $19.71 $

101

Waterless Urinal Cartridges for Sloan Urinal, Sloan WES-150 

(no substitutes) case of 12 CASE/# NO BID $ $686.95 $ $ $ $56.94 $ $ $ $ $ $519.00 ● 40.86$          $ $ $ $

102

Green” Urinal Screens with Deodorant Block Built In Avmor 

Biomor Urinal Pucks, Or Zep Bio Urinal Screen, Or Acceptable 

Equal Must be Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/# $19.00 $ $25.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $11.50 49.03$          $ $90.00 $19.71 $

103

Bowl Swab Brush, aka Johnny Mops, Made of an Acid 

Resistant, Bowl Swab Brush, aka Johnny Mops, Made of an 

Acid Resistant, Gordon's Supply #200 Series, Or Acceptable 

Equal CASE/# $31.08 $ ● $0.69 $ $ $ $96.00 $ $ $ $ $ ● $0.69 17.42$          $59.00 $ $0.86 $

104

Bowl Brush, 4" X 5" .15" Stiff White Tampico Fiber Bowl Brush 

With Colored Lacquered Handle With Metal Ferrule. CASE/# $36.00 $ $3.47 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $2.98 3.62$            $14.28 $ ● $2.66 $

105

Twisted in Wire Toilet Bowl Cleaning Brush, Overall Length 

20" Wright Bernet 1010 or Alcor or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $24.00 $ $42.44 $ $ $ $70.44 $ $ $ $ $ $25.92 ● 1.76$            $14.64 $ $2.66 $

106

Bowl Cleaner 20% Phosphoric Acid Toilet Bowl Cleaner. Stix 

Or Phoskleen Or Cling-Brite Or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $30.00 $ $26.45 $ $ $ $25.21 $ $ $ $ $ $26.29 ● 1.51$            $ $135.00 $32.08 $89.00

107

Non-Acid Thick Cling Liquid Disinfectant Bowl Cleaner  With a 

Powerful Deodorant. 32 oz Bowldozer 25-18 or Franklin Hi-

Genic or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $29.00 $ ● $18.08 $ $ $ $20.43 $ $ $ $ $ $19.59 38.58$          $ $ $25.32 $57.50

108

Urinal Mats, 17 1/2"x 20 1/2"x 1/4". Black, no aroma, anti-

microbial, non-slip,Urinal Mats, 17 1/2"x 20 1/2"x 1/4". Black, 

no aroma, anti-microbial, non-slip,  CASE/# $39.95 $ $35.21 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $26.42 59.25$          $ $75.00 $37.67 $

109

Power Plunger. Bell Shaped With Black Hard Rubber, 8" 

Diameter. Toilaflex Brand Or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $43.08 $ $4.12 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $3.12 4.59$            $47.88 $ $3.41 $

110

Industrial Plunger – Color:  Black BrassCraft Bellows Brand Or 

Acceptable Equal CASE/# $63.00 $ $78.38 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $3.22 5.13$            $ $ $6.95 $

111

Bodily Fluid Absorbent, 12oz Shakers Bodily Fluid Absorbent, 

12oz Shakers Must absorb minimum of 60 times its weight 

instantly Scottissue Super-Sorb Dri-Up or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $46.00 $ $34.67 $ $ $ $138.76 $ $ $ $ $ ● $32.72 39.76$          $34.98 $ $56.73

112

Heavy duty all purpose degreaser-Quart Size:  Spartan Tuff 

Orange or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $59.60 $ $25.65 $ $ ● $1.85 $48.76 $ $ $ $ $ $34.25 ● 1.85$            $ $ $43.30 $44.00

113

All Purpose Cleaner  Spartan Clean by Peroxy or Acceptable 

Equal – Size:  Gallon  Must be Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/# 38.5 $ 38.09 $ $ $ 53.56 $ $ $ $ $ 43.8 ● 10.00$          $ $99.00 69.15 $59.00

114

Spartan Clean by Peroxy or Acceptable Equal – Size:  5 

Gallon Must be Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/# $48.25 $ ● 38.09 $ $ $ $63.30 $ $ $ $ $ 43.8 48.95$          $ $125.00 $69.15

115

Non-toxic-biodegradable all purpose cleaner - quart size 

Simple Green or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $77.00 $ $68.69 $ $ ● $0.04 $ $ $ $ $ $ $51.25 ● 4.36$            $ $ $22.63 $28.99

116

“Green” Heavy Duty Degreaser  – Size:  Gallon Must be Green 

Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/# $42.00 $50.65

SELL PRICE IS 

$34.24/CS $47.75 ● 10.63$          $99.00 $69.15 $36.00

117

Cleaner & Odor Counteractant—Airx RX 75 Antibacterial H.D. 

Cleaner or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $48.25 $ $29.55 $ $ $ $67.22 $ $ $ $ $ $38.42 ● 19.80$          $ $ $

118

Cleaner and Degreaser, Dissolvable Packet (dissolves in 

water), 1/2 oz packet, 32 packets per tub, Heavy Duty, Easy 

Paks or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $62.00 $ $61.65 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $53.60 ● 33.55$          $ $ $55.99

119

Neutral Cleaner, No-rinse cleaner for high-gloss, alkaline-

sensitive surfaces. Easy-Paks 90 water-soluble packets per 

container. Johnson-Diversey 90653 or Acceptable Equal  CASE/# $59.10 $ $31.15 $ $ $ $58.23 $ $ $ $ $ $49.72 ● 28.07$          $ $ $101.64 $40.12

120 Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner DMQ or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $37.50 $ $31.51 $ $ $ $30.98 $ $ $ $ $ $30.75 ● 12.44$          $ $224.10 $35.47 $42.64

121

Liquid Mild Abrasive Cleanser - 26 oz Soft Scrub or Husky or 

Acceptable Equal CASE/# $34.60 $ $28.95 $ $ $44.82 $29.86 $ $ $ $ $ $26.45 ● 24.51$          $ $ $30.55 $

122

Heavy Duty Cleaner With Grit, 8-Liter To Fit Sani-Tuff 

Industrial Hand Care System #9975ZPL Sani-Tuff or 

Acceptable Equal CASE/# $96.75 $ $110.15 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $72.66 ● 19.14$          $ $ $85.20 $69.00

123 Multi-Purpose Cleaner – Size:  1.5 Liter Alpha or Acceptable EqualCASE/# NO BID $ $20.23 $ $ ● $0.79 $58.09 $ $ $ $ $ $49.25 11.39$          $ $ $63.31 $36.00
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124 Spic & Span Cleaner.  27 oz Box  (1 lb 11 oz) No substitute CASE/# ● $98.00 $ $111.90 $ $ $116.83 $114.16 $ $ $ $ $ $98.12 119.62$        $98.95 $ $124.54

125

Brake Parts Cleaner – Size:  20 oz Zep Brake Parts Cleaner or 

Acceptable Equal CASE/# $45.00 $ $53.58 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $47.15
●

3.54$            $ $99.00 $7,485.00 $29.30

126 Penetrating Lubricant – Size:  15 oz Zep 45 NC or Acceptable EqualCASE/# $46.00 $60.97 $75.48 $68.62 ● 7.74$            $41.95 $99.00 $109.89 $79.00

127 Soy-Based Penetrating Lubricant – Zep 70 or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $59.00 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $205.03 ● 6.38$            $ $ $ $90.00

128

All-in-One Penetrating Lubricant – Size:  15 oz Zep 

Zepreserve NC or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $49.75 $ $62.98 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $109.00
●

6.75$            $ $99.00 $ $79.80

129

Surfact Protectant Spray Ready To Use – Size:  Quart Zep 

Protect All or Acceptable Equal CASE/#
●

$65.80 $ $157.30 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $165.00 $ $99.00 $ $79.92

130

Heavy Duty Clear Penetrating Grease – Size:  24 oz Zep 

Brake Parts Cleaner or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $48.90 $ $16.70 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $47.15
●

3.28$            $ $ $63.00

131

Battery Terminal Cleaner and Leak Detector – Size:  20 oz Zep 

Battery Care or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $49.00 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $125.00
●

2.41$            $ $99.00 $ $33.36

DISINFECTANT/GERMICIDES (MSDS SHEETS)

132 Disinfectant Cleaner in 5 Gallon Container Buckeye Quart 256 CASE/# $66.75 $ $129.32 $ $ $ $88.98 $ $ $ $ $ $76.06 ● 52.12$          $ $ $82.46 $144.00

133

TB-Cide Quat (rotavirus, norovirus) TB-Cide Quat is a 

quaternary based, ready-to-use 

cleaner/deodorizer/disinfectant. A non-acid disinfectant for non-

porous, inanimate environmental surfaces.  Spartan Brand 

Only. NO SUBSTITUTIONS ● $193.50

Quart   CASE/# $62.75 $ $41.00 $ $ $ ● $31.45 $ $ $ $ $ $35.48 $ $ $31.46 $36.00

Gallon CASE/# NO BID $ $48.88 $ $ $ $37.44 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $37.40 ● $32.13

134

GS Neutral Disinfectant (rotavirus) GS Neutral Disinfectant 

Cleaner, quaternary disinfectant cleaner for high gloss floors, 

walls and other hard, nonporous surfaces. Spartan Brand Only 

NO SUBSTITUTIONS Size: Gallon CASE/# NO BID $43.51 $33.33 $34.85 ● 12.44$          $224.10 $39.57

135

GS High Dilution Disinfectant (rotavirus) GS High Dilution 

Disinfectant 256, phosphate-free effective cleaning, 

deodorizing, and disinfection.  Effective against methicillin 

resistant Staphylococcus aureus (MRSA) and vancomycin 

resistant Enterococcus faecalis (VRE). Spartan Brand Only. 

NO SUBSTITUTIONS Size: Gallon CASE/# NO BID $ $103.50 $ $ $ ● $79.24 $ $ $ $ $ $82.89 $ $ $82.46 $144.00

136

PD-128 (adenovirus) PD-128 is a phenolic, tuberculocidal 

disinfectant and cleaner effective against many bacteria, 

viruses, and fungi. Suitable for use in operating rooms, 

intensive care, emergency areas, patient rooms. Spartan 

Brand Only. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

DISCONTINUED 

BY THE 

MANUFACTURER

5 Gallon Bucket CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 7.19$            $ $ $ $

Gallon CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

137

“Green” All Purpose Disinfecting Cleaner 32oz  Must be Green 

Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/#
$78.24 $ $37.72 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

$34.85 ● 7.96$            
$ $ $ $

138

“Green” Disinfecting Restroom Cleaner 32 oz  Must be Green 

Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/#
NO BID $ $37.72 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

● $35.24
$ $ $ $

139

Germicidal Cleaner & Deodorant, Quat-Based, Ready To Use 

Citrus Fragrance with a minimum pH of 11.5 Zep Spirit II 32 oz 

or Acceptable Equal Must be Green Seal or Ecologo Certified CASE/#

$78.24 $ $47.55 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

$38.91 ● 5.10$            

$ $

$31.46

$36.00

140

All Purpose Germicidal Foaming Cleanser,For Spot Cleaning 

Woodwork, Tile, Metal, Painted Surfaces, Etc Must Kill HIV-1; 

HERPES SIMPLEX TYPE 1 & 2; Broad Spectrum Activity – 

Veridical, Fungicidal, Bactericidal, Pseudomyclocidal, 

Staphlocidal and Control Mold and Mildew. Aerosol 18-22oz 

can CASE/# $37.00 $ $43.54 $ $ $36.56 $30.60 $ $ $ $ $ $31.88 ● 3.19$            $29.98 $ $39.60 $58.89

141 Aerosol, 22 oz (Net) Can Bowman's Germicidal Cleaner Or Acceptable EqualCASE/# $37.00 $ $47.55 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $35.17 ● 2.35$            $ $ $46.35 $58.89

142

Spray Disinfectant For Mold & Mildew, Germicidal, 

Bactericidal, Fungicidal, Staphylocidal, Pseudomonicidal, 10 

oz Aerosol Can CASE/# $37.00 $ $38.24 $ $ $50.88 $38.52

$ $ $ $ $

● $28.03 66.37$          $29.79 $224.10 $46.35

143 Lysol aerosol 18-22 oz can or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $37.00 $ $47.55 $ $ $ $38.52 $ $ $ $ $ $35.17 ● 4.10$            $ $224.10 $60.07 $69.00

144 Lysol liquid 40 oz or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $60.06 $ $38.32 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $51.10 ● 33.39$          $ $ $34.40

145 Liquid Disinfectant – 144oz, Pinesol or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $39.75 $ $40.14 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $29.90 ● 12.08$          $ $ $31.08 $49.80

146

Non-Aerosol Quart Bottle With Pump. Spartan Asap, Or Apc 

Or Acceptable Equal CASE/#
$34.00 $ $38.32 $ $ $ $26.28 $ $ $ $ $

● $2.10 5.58$            
$ $128.70 $27.65 $
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147 Liquid 5.25% Chlorine Bleach CASE/# $17.25 $ $14.36 $ $ $ $10.08 $ $ $ $ $ $14.40 ● 2.02$            $ $ $ $25.50

148 Bleach,  Gallon Liquid 2.5% Solution CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 17.26$          $ $ ● $15.44 $25.50

149 Chlorine Free Bleach – Hydrogen Peroxide Based  Gallon CASE/# ● $27.60 $ $148.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $32.09 $ $ $

150

Paper Rag-On-A-Roll Blue Scrim Rolls Disposable Wipers – 

Size:  9-3/4" X 275 To fit in Bobrick dispenser Kimberly Clark 

#35411-B (35401 For White) Or Acceptable Equal CASE/# ● $55.00 $ $154.27 $ $ $ $77.17 $ $ $ $ $ $118.00 121.97$        $ $ $179.19

151

Scented Disinfecting Wipes, minimum of 75 wipes for 

container, Clorox,  Or Lysol Or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $44.44 $ $34.20 $ $ $ $53.04 $ $ $ $ $ ● $24.25 69.70$          $ $ $33.17 $35.60

GLASS CLEANERS AND TOOLS

152

Glass Cleaner, Undiluted, Gallon T-W Window Cleaner, 

Windows  Or Acceptable Equal CASE/#
$29.00 $ $68.32 $ $ $ $23.72 $ $ $ $ $ $62.85 ●

4.76$            
$ $110.00 $22.60 $24.56

153 Glass Cleaner Aerosol Spray, Contains No Ammonia 18 - 22oz canCASE/# $29.00 $ $30.95 $ $ $ $25.56 $ $ $ $ $ $22.71 ● 2.02$            $28.95 $89.00 $33.72 $43.80

154 Windex Window & Glass Cleaner (original) 32 oz. NO SUBSTITUTIONSCASE/# $37.00 $ $44.04 $ $ $ $63.60 $ $ $ $ $ $42.59 ● 4.79$            $ $ $61.15 $24.56

155

Highly absorbent sponges made from 100% Cellulose, 7-3/4 x 

4-3/8 x 1-5/8 #10SPA or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $37.25 $ $67.30 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $18.86 22.02$          $71.52 $ $21.49 $

156

Cotton Textile Rags/wipers-100% cotton knit, (packaged in 

box/dispenser preferred), 25lb. max.per box CASE/# $28.00 $ ● $20.35 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $39.30 37.95$          $ $ $ $

157 Duster & Extender Arm:  Swiffer 360 Duster W/Extender Or Acceptable Equal CASE/# NO BID $ $56.46 $ $ $ $63.09 $ $ $ $ $ $53.89 ● 11.08$          $ $ $65.02 $

Refills CASE/# NO BID $35.88 $39.46 $33.46 38.35$          ● $32.99

158

Stainless Steel Cleaner, Wipes Claire Stainless Steel Wipes 

40 count or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $58.98 $ $46.21 $ $ $ $59.94 $ $ $ $ $ $50.42 ● 8.32$            $53.98 $21.73 $

159 Stainless Steel Cleaner Claire C841 15oz or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $44.25 $ $27.28 $ $ $ $51.00 $ $ $ $ $ $27.75 ● 5.97$            $31.97 $99.00 $50.05 $59.00

160 “Green” Stainless Steel Cleaner, Liquid 32oz or Wipes 40 count CASE/# $47.00 $ $30.81 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $64.05 ● 3.40$            $ $ $55.65 $

161

Heavy Duty, Commercial, Steel Wool Soap Pads.  Extra Thick 

15 pads per box. SOS brand or acceptable equal. CASE/#
$40.00 $ $4.15 $ $ $ $49.08 $ $ $ $ $ $3.87

4.88$            
$28.98 $ ● $3.43 $

162

Scouring Pad, Green, Medium Duty, 6” x 9” 3M Niagara 96N 

or acceptable Equal CASE/#
$12.34 $ $28.09 $ $ $ $8.60 $ $ $ $ $ $4.95 ●

0.65$            
$12.99 $ $5.27 $

163 Liquid Soap - Dawn 9 FL. OZ. NO SUBSTITUTIONS CASE/# $44.61 $ $30.76 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $24.78 $ $ $

164 Liquid Soap - Dawn 38 oz  NO SUBSTITUTIONS CASE/# $44.61 $ $43.08 $ $ $ $48.56 $ $ $ $ $ $39.54 ● 6.05$            $ $ $48.61

165 Liquid Soap - Dawn Industrial Soap Gallon CASE/# $65.00 $ $52.19 $ $ $ $72.63 $ $ $ $ $ ● $47.86 87.86$          $ $ $69.68

166 Liquid Laundry Detergent - 150 oz (96 Loads) Ultra Purex or Acceptable EqualCASE/# $47.14 $ $52.58 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $39.85 59.73$          $ $60.00 $55.05

167

Fantastik with Scrubbing Bubbles Heavy Duty All Purpose 

Cleaner, non-aerosol, 32 oz. (Quart). NO SUBSTITUTIONS CASE/# 49.04 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $23.25
●

3.13$            $ $ $30.24

168 Tilex Mildew Remover, non-aerosol, 32 oz. (quart). NO SUBSTITUTIONSCASE/# 43.95 $ 47.72 $ $ $ 62.91 $ $ $ $ $ $28.03 ● 5.43$            $ $99.00 $5.59 32.23 

169

Oven and Grill Cleaner – 18 oz Aerosol, Lemon Scented 

Spartan #6280 or Acceptable Equal CASE/# 36.81 $ 42.71 $ $ $ 35.28 $ $ $ $ $ $34.27
●

3.53$            35.98 $99.00 $50.50

170 Washing Detergent - All Multipurpose 50lbs CASE/# 36.25 49.45 43 ● $19.95 28.46$          $24.46

171
Vehicle Wash Detergent – Environmentally Friendly - 55 

Gallon drum Zep Ultrasuds or Acceptable Equal CASE/# 592.47 $ 418.75 $ $ $ 387.68 $ $ $ $ $ ● $185.00 $ $950.00 $369.22

172 Formula 409 Heavy Duty Cleaner 32oz CASE/# 42.54 $ 41.96 $ $ $ 67.68 $ $ $ $ $ $39.85 ● 1.93$            49.98 $ $27.67 $36.00

173 CLR Lime Cleaner Gallon CASE/# 68.18 $ 115.88 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $75.18 ● 10.12$          $ $ $38.03

174 Goo B-Gone 12oz CASE/# 41.49 $ 33.65 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $3.76 ● 3.50$            $ $ $27.79

175 Orange Cleaner with pump Gallon CASE/# 75.25 $ 74.82 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $94.96 ● 22.58$          $ $ $23 

176 Gum Remover 3oz CASE/# 37.49 $ 23.21 $ $ $ 29.52 $ $ $ $ $ $28.68 58.68$          29.75 $ ● $7.26

177 Windsor Compass 2 Touchless Restroom Cleaner CASE/# NO BID $ ● $4,397.28 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $4,885.00 $ $ $

HAND SOAP / SANITIZER

178

Pink Lotion Hand Soap – Size:  12 Liter Bobrick “Sureflow” 

“Tank in a Box” or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $55.25 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $47.24 ● 9.79$            $ $ $ $

179 Pink Lotion Hand Soap – Size:  1k Liter Carex or Acceptable EqualCASE/# $29.63 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $18.74 68.64$          $ $ $38.00

180 Foaming refresh refill 800 ml  Stoko - no substitutes CASE/# $56.24 $ $62.31 $ $ $ 55 $ $ $ $ $ $55.24 ● 13.60$          $ $ $

181 Liquid hand and body soap (non-foaming)-Gallon size True EssenceCASE/# $34.25 $ $ $ ● $25.80 $ 40.59 $ $ $ $ $ $55.21 50.10$          $ $511.20 $46.70

182 Soft Bottle Hand Soap - Size:  2000ml  Estesol CASE/# $114.80 $ $72.55 $ $ $ 65.34 $ $ $ $ $ $45.81 ● 17.03$          $ $ $

183

Gentle Hand Soap 800 ml Size  To Fit Soft & Silky Dispensing 

System #9950ZPL SSS Sanifresh Gentle Hand Soap, 

Dermacare or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $29.63 $ $44.51 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 7.00$            $ $ ● $6.50

184

Pink Lotion Hand Soap Refill – Size:  800 mL Gojo® “Pink & 

Clean” or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $29.34 $ $28.53 $ $41.33 $ 32.76 $ $ $ $ $ $26.64 ● 2.96$            $ $ $33.23

185 Hand Soap  1000 mL Gojo® NXT 1000 mL Refill CASE/# $65.25 $ $65.35 $ $68.97 $ 63.33 $ $ $ $ $ $59.48 $ $ ● $54.16

186

Waterless Hand Cleaner With Grit, 8 oz Disposable Bottle. 

Gojo® OR Acceptable Equal CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $37.39 2.38$            $ $144.00 $

187

Instant Hand Sanitizer, 8 oz Bottle with pump, KIMCARE # 

93060 or Acceptable Equal CASE/# $41.25 $ $51.65 $ $ $ 56.37 $ $ $ $ $ ● $29.40 49.19$          $41.88 $217.80 $47.71

188
Instant Hand Sanitizer Refill Purrell 962112 or Acceptable 

Equal CASE/# $56.12 $ $126.25 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $12.02 ● 7.00$            $ $ $152.45

189 Hand Soap Dispenser – Size:  800 mL Gojo® “Bag-in-box” Dispenser CASE/# $29.63 $ $16.31 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $0.00 ● 12.94$          $ $ $

PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLES

190 Plastic Spray Bottles

16oz CASE/# $28.64 $ $74.09 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● 2.43$            $29.50 $ $17.84 $

24oz CASE/# $28.64 $ $47.42 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $9.20 ● 3.91$            $31.00 $ $17.86 $

32oz CASE/# $28.64 $ $52.05 $ $ $ 78.72 $ $ $ $ $ $11.40 ● 0.40$            $31.50 $ $8.87 $

191 Plastic Spray Bottles trigger/nozzle to fit bottle bid above
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CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For:  JANITORIAL SLUPPLIES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.:  VARIOUS IFB No.:  21007N

Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened:   2:00 P.M.; 2-5-2021

No.:

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE & ZIP:

Recommended for Award

QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?

QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?

LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?
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16oz CASE/# $36.17 $ $115.66 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $8.04 ● 0.51$            $172.50 $ $12.21 $

24oz CASE/# $36.17 $ $115.66 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $8.04 ● 0.24$            $172.50 $ $12.21 $

32oz CASE/# $36.17 $ $190.01 $ $ $ 216 $ $ $ $ $ $8.04 ● 1.79$            $177.50 $ $12.21 $

DISPOSABLE / NON-DISPOSABLE GLOVES

192 13" Green Flock-Lined Glove

Small CASE/# 17.8 $ $20.75 $ $ $ 1.48/PAIR $ $ $ $ $ $16.51 ● 1.74$            $ $ $ $

Medium CASE/# 17.8 $ $20.21 $ $ $ 1.98/PAIR $ $ $ $ $ $16.51 ● 1.18$            $ $ $ $

Large CASE/# 17.8 $ $20.21 $ $ $ 25.44/DOZEN $ $ $ $ $ $16.51 ● 1.18$            $ $ $ $

X-Large CASE/# 17.8 $ $20.21 $ $ $ 2.04/PAIR $ $ $ $ $ $16.51 ● 1.18$            $ $ $ $

193

Disposable gloves, latex, powder free, Duraskin or Acceptable 

Equal

Small CASE/# NO BID $ $105.05 $ $ $ $ $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $101.79 ● 10.45$          $ $ $ $

Medium CASE/# NO BID $ $105.05 $ $ $ $ $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $101.79 ● 10.17$          $ $ $ $

Large CASE/# NO BID $ $105.05 $ $ $ $ $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $101.79 ● 10.17$          $ $ $ $

X-Large CASE/# NO BID $ $105.05 $ $ $ $ $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $138.00 $101.79 ● 10.17$          $ $ $ $

194

Disposable gloves, latex, powder free – Color:  Black Duraskin 

BlackShield or Acceptable Equal

Small CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ 17.47/BX OF 100 $ $ $ $ $ $180.00 ● 10.17$          $ $ $ $

Medium CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ 17.47/BX OF 100 $ $ $ $ $ $180.00 ● 12.91$          $ $ $ $

Large CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ 17.47/BX OF 100 $ $ $ $ $ $180.00 ● 13.36$          $ $ $ $

X-Large CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ ● 17.47/BX OF 100 $ $ $ $ $ $180.00 $ $ $ $

195 Disposable gloves, nitrile, non-latex, powder free

Small CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ 18.76/BX OF 100 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $160.00 ● 10.56$          $ $ $185.00 $120.04 $

Medium CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ 18.76/BX OF 100 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $160.00 ● 10.56$          $ $ $185.00 $120.04 $

Large CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ 18.76/BX OF 100 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $160.00 ● 30.00$          $ $ $185.00 $120.04 $

X-Large CASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $ 18.76/BX OF 100 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $348.00 $160.00 ● 4.86$            $ $ $185.00 $120.04 $

196 Disposable gloves, vinyl, powder free 

Small CASE/# NO BID $ $93.75 $ $ $ 12.54/BX OF 100 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $79.00 ● 11.86$          $159.90 $ $115.00 $ $

Medium CASE/# NO BID $ $93.75 $ $ $ 12.54/BX OF 100 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $79.00 11.86$          $159.90 $ $115.00 ● $11.03 $

Large CASE/# NO BID $ $93.75 $ $ $ 12.54/BX OF 100 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $79.00 11.86$          $159.90 $ $115.00 ● $11.03 $

X-Large CASE/# NO BID $ $93.75 $ $ $ 12.54/BX OF 100 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $79.00 ● 10.96$          $159.90 $ $115.00 $11.03 $

AIR FRESHNERS / DEODORIZERS

197

Air Fresheners & Deodorizers: Claire Air Freshener 7oz or 

Acceptable Equal CASE/# $47.00 $ $33.99 $ $ $ $35.64 $ $ $ $ $ $14.98 ● 2.82$            $31.99 $ $34.10

198 Dry Deodorizer, 10 oz Aerosol Cans CASE/# $47.00 $ $41.45 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $14.98 ● 2.79$            $32.15 $ $

199 Insect Repellant, 6 oz Can Spray On, HP #37470 or Acceptable EqualCASE/# NO BID $ $73.35 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $56.18 ● 5.56$            $66.98 $76.00 $88.34

200

Insecticide, Flying Insect, Broad Spectrum For Ticks, Fleas, 

Spiders, Gnats, Mosquitoes, Flies, Etc. – Size: 15 oz 

Aerosol,Misty Dualcide P3 or Acceptable Equal CASE/# 71.15 $ $47.75 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $54.50 ● 9.98$            $43.98 $150.00 $64.76

201

Insecticide, flying insect for wasps, hornets, bees, etc.20 oz. 

aerosol HP Jet Force Wasp & Hornet Killer or Acceptable 

Equal CASE/# 45.8 $ $49.31 $ $ $ $43.56 $ $ $ $ $ $43.24 ● 5.56$            $47.98 $99.00 $70.48

202

Insecticide, Residual Spray, For Cockroaches, Ants, Ticks, 

Fleas, 18,000 Volt Dielectric Strength, Pleasant fragrance – 

Size:  15 oz Aerosol, CASE/# 44.15 $ $59.76 $ $ $ $54.00 $ $ $ $ $ $47.47 ● 5.80$            $ $110.00 $64.76

MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS 

203
Tampons, Individually Wrapped (500/Case)Platex Gentle 

Glide or Acceptable Equal CASE 58.79 $ $55.85 $ $ $ $73.91 $ $ $ $ $ ● $52.54 70.57$          $60.98 $ $69.66 $

204

Maxi-Pads, Individually Wrapped (250/Case) Hospeco Gards 

or Acceptable Equal CASE 52.18 $ ● $27.55 $ $ $ $36.88 $ $ $ $ $ $37.37 32.61$          $33.98 $ $37.15 $

205 Absorbent Booms for fuel/ oil spillage containment CASE/# NO BID $ $58.55 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $83.49 ● 20.13$          $ $ $ $

206

Aerosol Wood Polish. Oil Based, 19 oz. Can, Super Shine 

#3221 Aerosol Wood Polish or Acceptable Equal CASE/# 36.28 $ $43.41 $ $ $ $35.28 $ $ $ $ $ $28.15 ● 3.61$            $32.99 $ $41.13 $64.68 

207 Mop, Dust 5X36 Disposable See O Cedar 96937 CASE/# 79.08 $ $107.01 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $38.84 110.65$        $51.48 $ $64.79 $

208 Mop, Dust , 5X24 Disposable See O Cedar 96928 CASE/# 79.08 $ $76.21 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $29.22 87.12$          $43.08 $ $47.85 $

209
Lens cleaning towels, anti-fog and anti-static, safe on all lens 

coatings.  Individually wrapped  8”X5”, 1000 per box
CASE/# 59.15 $ $56.51 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $54.87 ● 3.96$            $ $ $ $

210

SC Johnson Professional Kresto extra heavy duty paste hand 

cleaner, with walnut shell scrubbers 2000ML dispenser refill, 6 

per case manufacturer# 98704506 CASE 113.24 $ $36.75 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $123.25 ● 18.62$          $ $ $ $69 

211 Disinfectant, husky lemon- gallon, 4 gallon/case CASE 37.16 $ $30.51 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $38.78 11.74$          $ $ $31.08 $42.64 

212 Softsoap liquid hand soap with Aloe-  gallon, 4 gallon/case CASE 44.15 $ $42.51 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $41.69 74.12$          $ $ $46.63 $48.60 

x 1.05 Local/Certified Preference Price ● $41.69

213
Soap, Kutol Health Guard 1000 ml Enriched moisture wash 

6/case MFR# 64141 CASE $44.15 $ $51.08 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $45.96 ● 7.23$            $ $ $45.10 $45.00 

214

White towels, non perforated, 8” diameter 1000’ long, 12 per 

case Nittany paper 12100EX CASE $73.12 $ ● $22.93 $ $ $

49.93/CASE OF 6 

ROLLS (1000') $ $ $ $ $ $37.84 47.26$          $ $ $ $

CLEANING EQUIPMENT & ACCESSORIES

Across the board discount ______% or mark-up 

______% on Cleaning Equipment & Accessories 10% % % % % % % % % % % %

50% discount off 

catalog list % % % %

215 Windsor Sensor XP 15” Vacuum EACH NO BID $ ● $519.00 $ $ $ $681.60 EACH $ $ $ $ $ $675.00 $ $ $ $
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216

Vacuum Bags for Windsor Sensor XP 15” Vacuum 

CASE/# $99.15 $ $12.21 $ $ $

$20.53/PACK OF 

10 $ $ $ $ $ ● $7.45 $ $ $76.68 $

217 Vacuum Bags for Windsor Chariot iVac 24” ATV CASE/# $27.25 $ ● $71.20 $ $ $

$128.00/PACK OF 

10 $ $ $ $ $ $16.16 $ $ $159.51 $

218 Vacuum Bags for Advance/Carpetriever J90/Class A CASE/# $147.25 $ $6.67 $ $ $

$68.69/PACK OF 

10 $ $ $ $ $ ● $6.15 $ $ $ $

219 Vacuum Bags for NuSource Wide Vacuum 14” CASE/# NO BID $ $5.52 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 127.93$        $ $ $ $

220 Hoover Vacuum Belt (#38528-033) CASE/# ● $3.12 $ $0.83 $ $ $ $2.47 EACH $ $ $ $ $ $7.95 1.37$            $ $ $ $

221 Tennant  (Nobles) V-SMU-14 Vacuum  14" EACH NO BID $ $385.55 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $535.00 ● 223.74$        $ $ $ $

222 Hoover CH54115 Vacuum  15" EACH $491.50 $ ● $283.40 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $325.00 345.00$        $ $ $ $

223 Hoover CH93406 Backpack Vacuum EACH $470.00 $ $289.15 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $353.00 ● 172.00$        $ $ $ $

224 Vacuum Bags for Tennant V-SMU-14 CASE/# $49.00 $ $27.10 $ $ 7.4 $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $5.35 $ $ $317.06 $

225 Vacuum Bags for Hoover CH54115 CASE/# $55.00 $ ● $12.00 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $13.25 12.92$          $ $ $ $

226 Hoover Backpack Vacuum Batteries for CH93406 CASE/# $345.00 $ ● $192.77 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $265.00 277.99$        $ $ $ $

227 Filters/Hepa Filters for Nobles, Tennant V-SMU-14 CASE/# NO BID $ ● $15.80 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $28.75 31.81$          $ $ $31.90 $

228 Filters/Hepa Filters for Hoover CH54115 CASE/# NO BID $ $29.50 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ● $29.15 32.30$          $ $ $ $

229 Filters/Hepa Filters for Hoover CH93406 Backpack Vacuum CASE/# $14.75 $ ● $9.25 $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $29.15 $ $ $ $

230 Oxivir Wipes - Disinfectant, Virucide Wipes 7" x 8", 60 wipes/canisterCASE/# $119.55 $ $ $ $ $

$124.64/CASE OF 

12 $ $ $ $ $ ● $79.25 199.97$        $ $ 161.6 $

231 Oxivir Wipes - Disinfectant, Virucide Wipes 11" x 12", 160 wipes/canisterCASE/# NO BID $ $ $ $ $

$219.03/CASE OF 

12 $ $ $ $ $ ● $133.25 155.01$        $ $ 154.85 $

232

Kimberly-Clark WypAll L40 All-Purpose Wiper, Blue, 9 boxes 

per case/100 wipes per box KC #05740. NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS CASE $105.25 $ $113.76 $ $ $ ●

$75.96/CASE OF 

9BX $ $ $ $ $ 87.04 95.16$          $ $ 109.47 $

Firm Price Agreement

Through April 30, 2022   YES / NO YES YES YES YES YES NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

6 Months

Options to renew for additional 12-months

May 1, 2022 through April 30, 2023

    Maximum Percentage of increase

Options to renew for additional 12-months

May 1, 2023 through April 30, 2024

    Maximum Percentage of increase

Options to renew for additional 12-months

May 1, 2024 through April 30, 2025

    Maximum Percentage of increase

TERMS:

F.O.B.:
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